

**OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY APPROVED MINUTES OF MARCH 8, 2019**

The Oglala Lakota Board of County Commissioners met in regular session on March 8, 2019. Present: Ramon Bear Runner, Art Hopkins, Eugenio White Hawk, and Sue Ganje, Auditor. Anna Takes the Shield and Wendell Yellow Bull were absent.

The Pledge of Allegiance was given, and the meeting called to order at 10:56 a.m. by Vice-Chairman White Hawk. The agenda was reviewed for conflicts. ALL MOTIONS RECORDED IN THESE MINUTES WERE PASSED BY UNANIMOUS VOTE, UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED.

Motion made by Hopkins, seconded by Bear Runner, to approve the agenda as written.

Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to approve the minutes of February 1, 2019.

Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to approve the Auditor's Account with the Treasurer as follows:

**AUDITOR'S ACCOUNT WITH THE COUNTY TREASURER  
TO THE HONORABLE BOARD OF OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY  
COMMISSIONERS:**

I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in the hands of the County Treasurer of this County on this 31<sup>st</sup> day of January, 2019.

Total Amt of Deposit in First Interstate Bank, HS:	<u>\$16,617.38</u>
Total Amount of Cash:	<u>\$1,829.30</u>
Total Amount of Checks in Treasurer's	
Possession Not Exceeding Three Days:	<u>\$2,319.48</u>
MONEY MARKET SAVINGS:	
First Interstate-Hot Springs:	<u>\$1,902,100.26</u>
CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT:	
First Interstate-Hot Springs:	<u>\$200,000.00</u>
Black Hills Federal Credit Union:	<u>\$50,000.00</u>

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts that have been in the Treasurer's possession over three days:

Sheriff Change Fund: \$200.00  
Election Petty Cash: \$15.00

Treasurer Shortage:

RETURNED CHECKS:

Okolakiciye, Tasunke                      \$1,194.61 – LIC, 01/02/2019

TOTAL \$2,174,276.03

Dated This 31<sup>st</sup> Day of January, 2019.

/s/Sue Ganje

Sue Ganje, County Auditor of Oglala Lakota County

County Monies: \$2,095,224.80

Held for other Entities: \$42,933.83

Held in Trust: \$36,117.40

TOTAL: \$2,174,276.03

The Above Balance Reflects County Monies, Monies Held in Trust, and Monies Collected for and to be remitted to Other ENTITIES: SCHOOLS, TOWNS, AND STATE.

Joe Herman, Sheriff, met with the board to review his monthly report. Discussion was held on the proposed jail contract at the OST Justice Center, including the bond requirements from one entity to another; video arraignment; inventory; concealed carry permits; jurisdiction issues and the possibility for deputies in the future.

Frank Maynard, Emergency Management, met with the board to request an acknowledgement letter recognizing the Wakpamni Fire Department. Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to authorize the vice-chairman to sign the letter acknowledging Wakpamni Lake Fire Department as a fire entity, as per SDCL, for fire suppression, including mutual aid agreements with other resources.

Lynx Bettelyoun, Highway Superintendent, met with the board. Discussion was held about the location of the Bennett County sign on SD Hwy 18, which is still Oglala Lakota County on the south side of the road, and of his contact with SD DOT. Bettelyoun will pursue this issue and bring updates back to the board.

Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to approve travel for Bettelyoun to attend the short course in Deadwood, March 26 through March 28, 2019.

Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to approve purchasing culverts off of the 2019 Beadle County culvert bids.

Motion made by Hopkins, seconded by Bear Runner, to approve a transfer to reimburse the highway department for sheriff fuel, 172.1 gallons at \$2.014 per gallon, for a total of \$346.61.

Fuel quotes were presented as follows:

2-25-19	550-Gal Gas	600-Gal #1 Dyed Diesel	800-Gal Propane
Westco	\$2.114/gal	\$2.819/gal	\$1.449/gal
Pine Ridge Oil	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Nelson's	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lakota Plains	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to approve the low bid from Westco at \$2.114 per gallon for 550 gallons of unleaded gas; \$2.819 per gallon for 600 gallons of #1 dyed diesel and \$1.449 per gallon for 800 gallons of propane.

The 2019 Private road work hearing was held as advertised. Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to approve the continuation of private road work in 2019 as per SDCL 31-11-40 through 31-11-45.

Susie Hayes, Director of Equalization, met with the board. Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to set the County Board of Equalization date for April 12, 2019, at 10:00 a.m.

Brian Ahrendt, Fall River County State's Attorney, met with the board. Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to appoint Brian Ahrendt as Oglala Lakota County State's Attorney for the remainder of the Oglala Lakota – State's Attorney Contract, through December 31, 2019.

Motion made by Hopkins, seconded by Bear Runner, to approve the bills as follows:

**GENERAL FUND**

AT&T MOBILITY	WIRELESS PHONE SHERIFF	\$75.11
BEAR RUNNER, RAMON	MILEAGE	\$46.20
CENTURY BUSINESS	COPIER LEASE/METER	\$21.09
ELECTION SYSTEMS & SOFT	ELECTION SYSTEM MAIN	\$1,872.00
EFTPS	PAYROLL TAXES	\$2,341.04
FALL RIVER CO. SHERIFF	INMATE HOUSING	\$800.00
CARDMEMBER SERVICE	CARDMEMBER SERVICES	\$93.69
FIRST INTERSTATE BANK	FIRST INTERSTATE	\$34.05
GOLDEN WEAT	LOCAL PHONE/EMAIL/LONG DISTANCE	\$291.42
HOPKINS, ARTHUR L	MILEAGE	\$95.76
HUNT, KAREN PAIGE	MI QHMP	\$65.80
LAKOTA COUNTRY TIMES	PUBLICATION	\$226.60
LINCOLN COUNTY TREASURER	MI	\$45.00
MARTINEZ, AUDREY	CORONER MILEAGE	\$133.56
MASTEL, BRUCE	WEB HOST/UPDATE/SERVER	\$35.00
MCLEOD'S OFFICE SUPPLY	SUPPLIES	\$68.23
MICROFILM IMAGING SYSTEMS	SCANNING EQUIPMENT LEAST	\$17.50

OGLALA SIOUX TRIB	MONTH RENT FOR VETERAN'S SERVICE OFFICER	\$100.00
RESERVE ACCOUNT	POSTAGE METER PITNEY	\$393.00
PSECO	INSTALLATION	\$204.00
QUALIFIED PRESORT SERVICE	2018 PROPERTY TAX	\$286.54
QUILL CORPORATION	SUPPLY	\$271.87
RELIANCE STANDARD	LIFE INSURANCE	\$75.50
SD ASSN OF COUNTY COMM.	COUNTY COMMISSIONER	\$500.00
SD DEPT OF REVENUE	LICENSE PLATE AND TITLE	\$21.20
SDAO	ANNUAL CONFERENCE	\$175.00
SD SHERIFF'S ASSOCIATION	2019 SHERIFF ASSOCIATION	\$907.58
SECRETARY OF STATE	PISTOL PERMITS	\$86.00
SD DEPT OF REVENUE	AUTO/MI STATE REMITT	\$60.00
SKINNER, MATTHEW	CAAF	\$21.40
SD STATE RETIREMENT	SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS	\$1,406.56
WHITE HAWK, EUGENIO	MILEAGE	\$74.76
GARCIA, ALBINO	PISTOL PERMIT REFUND	\$10.00
POURIER, BAILEY	PISTOL PERMIT REFUND	\$10.00
COMMISSIONERS	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$750.00
AUDITOR'S OFFICE	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$1,389.58
TREASURER'S OFFICE	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$1,389.58
STATE'S ATTORNEY'S OFFICE	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$2,583.33
REGISTER OF DEEDS OFFICE	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$1,389.58
VETERAN'S SERVICE OFFICE	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$1,291.67
SHERIFF'S OFFICE	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$3,727.08
CORONER	FEBRUARY SALARIES	\$540.00
	TOTAL FOR GENERAL FUND	\$23,926.28

**COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE**

A & B WELDING SUPPLY	WELDING SUPPLY/LEASE	\$46.50
AMERITAS	DENTAL/VISION INSURANCE	\$148.16
AT&T MOBILITY	WIRELESS PHONE SHERIFF	\$86.10
BETTELYOUN, LYNX	MEALS REIMBURSEMENT	\$25.80
BLUE CROSS/BLUE SHIELD	HEALTH INSURANCE PREMIUM	\$1,753.35
BROSZ ENGINEERING, INC.	CONTRACT SERVICES	\$360.00
CULLIGAN	UTILITY/WATER DISPENSER	\$11.00
EFTPS	PAYROLL TAXES	\$2,900.14
CARDMEMBER SERVICE	CARDMEMBER SERVICES	\$754.36
GENERAL STORE	SUPPLY	\$226.84
GODFREY BRAKE SERVICE	PARTS	\$723.79
GREAT PLAINS COMMUNICATION	LOCAL PHONE & INTERNET	\$186.39
HUSKER AUTO PARTS	AUTO PARTS/SUPPLIES	\$6.29
INLAND TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE	PARTS	\$137.16
LACREEK ELECTRIC ASSOC	UTILITY/ELECTRIC	\$670.62
MARTIN AUTO PARTS	PARTS/SUPPLY	\$78.78

MCI COMM SERVICE	LONG DISTANCE PHONE	\$49.02
MENARDS	SUPPLY	\$458.67
MODERN FARM EQUIPMENT CO.	2018 TRACTOR RENTAL	\$3,600.00
MONTANA CSED	CHILD SUPPORT	\$441.16
RELIANCE STANDARD	LIFE INSURANCE	\$90.75
SDACHS	2019 SHORT COURSE	\$100.00
SD FEDERAL PROPERTY AGCY	SUPPLIES	\$199.00
SD STATE RETIREMENT	SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS	\$1,494.92
WYOMING CHILD SUPPORT	CHILD SUPPORT	\$542.00
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT	JANUARY SALARIES	\$12,574.11
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT	OVERTIME	\$450.63
	TOTAL FOR COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE	\$28,115.54
	TOTAL PAID BETWEEN 2/2/19 AND 3/8/19	\$52,041.82

No public comment was given. Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Hopkins, to adjourn at 12:52 p.m.

/s/ Eugenio White Hawk  
Eugenio White Hawk, Vice-Chairman  
Board of Oglala Lakota County  
Commissioners

ATTEST:  
/s/ Sue Ganje  
Sue Ganje, Oglala Lakota County Auditor