OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY UNAPPROVED MINUTES OF NOVEMBER 14, 2022

The Oglala Lakota Board of County Commissioners met in regular session on November
14, 2022. Present: Art Hopkins, Anna Takes the Shield (DuBray) Eugenio White Hawk and Aaron
Eberle, Administrative Assistant, Auditor’s Office. Ramon Bear Runner, Wendell Yellow Bull and
Sue Ganje, Auditor, were absent.

The meeting was called to order at 1:18 p.m. by Chairman White Hawk and the pledge was
given. The agenda was reviewed for conflicts; none were noted. ALL MOTIONS RECORDED IN
THESE MINUTES WERE PASSED BY UNANIMOUS VOTE, UNLESS OTHERWISE
STATED.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Hopkins, to approve the agenda
as written.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Hopkins, to approve the minutes
of October 12, 2022.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Hopkins, to approve the
September Auditor’s Account with the Treasurer as follows:

AUDITOR'S ACCOUNT WITH THE COUNTY TREASURER

TO THE HONORABLE BOARD OF OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS:

I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in

the hands of the County Treasurer of this County on this 30th day of September 2022.

Total Amount of Deposit in First Interstate Bank, HS: $ 104,606.32

Total Amount of Cash: $ 1,047.15

Total Amount of Checks in Treasurer's
Possession Not Exceeding Three Days: $ 711.43

FIRST INTERSTATE SAVINGS
First Interstate, HS: $ 2,773,670.87

CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT:

First Interstate, HS: $ 202,257.05
Black Hills Federal Credit Union, HS: $ 50,000.00
First National Bank of Lead Checking $ 1,000.00
First Nation Bank of Lead ICS Acct $ 2,552,342.31

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts that have



been in the Treasurer's possession over three days:

Sheriff Change Fund:
Election Petty Cash:

RETURNED CHECKS:
Deaton, Tyler

TOTAL

Dated This 30th Day of September 2022.

/s/Sue Ganje, County Auditor of Oglala Lakota County

[s/Teresa Pullen, County Treasurer of Oglala Lakota County

County Monies $ 5,625,768.00
Held for other Entities $ 11,340.87
Held in Trust $ 48,851.36
TOTAL $ 5,685,960.23

$ 200.00
$ 15.00
$ 110.10

$ b5,685,960.23

The Above Balance Reflects County Monies, Monies Held in Trust, and Monies
Collected for and to be remitted to Other ENTITIES: SCHOOLS, TOWNS, AND STATE.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Hopkins, to approve setting a

supplement and contingency hearing for December 14, 2022 at 1:10 p.m.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Hopkins, to table the current
supplement and contingency hearing until the December 14, 2022 meeting at 1:10 p.m.

Gary Ruse, CEO Economic Director representing ECHAGA Group, acting as an
intermediary between the owners and the purchaser of property. Janelle L Finck, representing KTM
Design Solutions, the surveying company presenting the plat, met with the Board.

Yellow Bull entered the meeting at 1:24 p.m.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve the

following resolution:

OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY RESOLUTION #2022-12

A Plat of Lots 1 and 2 of Tract 25 (formerly Tract 25 less Lot H-1) located in Section 12,
T35N, R45W, 6" P.M., Oglala Lakota County, South Dakota



WHEREAS, there has been presented to the County Commissioners of Oglala Lakota
County, South Dakota, the within plat of the above described lands, and it appearing to the Board
that the system of streets conforms to the system of streets of existing plats and section lines of the
county; adequate provision is made for access to adjacent unplatted lands by public dedication or
section line when physically accessible; all provisions of the county subdivision regulations have
been completed with; all taxes and special assessments upon the property have been fully paid, and
the plat and survey have been lawfully executed; now and thereafter,

BE IT RESOLVED that said plat is hereby approved in all respects.
Dated this 14" day of November, 2022.

/s/Eugenio White Hawk, Chairman
Oglala Lakota County Board of Commissioners

ATTEST:
/s/Stacy Schmidt
Oglala Lakota County Deputy Auditor

Bear Runner joined the meeting at 1:38 p.m.

The Official Canvass for the 2022 General Election was conducted. Motion made by Bear
Runner, seconded by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve the Official 2022 General Election
Canvass.

No public comment was heard.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Hopkins, to approve tabling the
delinquent tax agreement and waiving of interest policy until the next meeting, when the Treasurer
could be available.

Stacey Martin, GIS, reported to the Board, that she has been doing research regarding online
mapping programs that would be affordable for them and Fall River County. Martin will bring back
a quote to the next meeting. This would allow time for Martin to do further research and get a better
feel for Fall River County’s decision will be and if both boards wanted to go together.

Joe Herman, Sheriff, reported to the Board that 2 deputies have resigned and 2 vehicles will
probably need to be sold or traded off in the future. Herman will get quotes if funding will be
allowable. Discussion was held on Herman helping the Oglala Lakota Sioux Tribe search for
missing tribal members; the County’s side by sides have been being used in the search, one of the
older ones will need to be replaced.

Discussion was held on setting up a Dispatch Center at the Highway Shop, since Oglala
Lakota County is lower on the priority list with the Tribe and Fall River County. The Board
questioned having Audrey Martinez assist more with sheriff duties, reports of stolen/missing cattle,
hours that Sheriff was putting in, getting a policy in place sooner rather than later, having written



reports at meetings, tribal work that may be stressing him and different ways of hiring better
employees.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (Dubray), seconded by Yellow Bull, to table the sheriff’s
report until Herman can come back with a written report.

Bear Runner exited the meeting at 3:19 p.m.
Lynx Bettelyoun, Highway Superintendent, met with the Board. Motion made by Yellow
Bull, seconded by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve the October 1 — October 25, 2022 sheriff

fuel transfer to reimburse the highway for 386.9 gallons of fuel at $3.882 per gallon, for a total of
$1,501.95.

Fuel quotes were presented as follows:

10/24/2022 Fuel Quotes 550-Gal Gasoline 1,000-Gal Diesel 600-Gal Propane

Westco $3.649/gallon $5.199/gallon $1.999/gallon
Lakota Plains No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pine Ridge Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nelson’s No Bid No Bid No Bid
Discount Fuel No Bid No Bid No Bid

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve the low
and only bid from Westco for 550 gallons of gasoline at $3.649 per gallon, for a total of $2,006.95,
1,000 gallons of diesel, at $5.199 per gallon, for a total of $5,199.00, and 600 gallons of propane at
$1.999 per gallon, for a total of $1,199.40.

Bettelyoun updated the Board that a concrete pad has been poured for the new fuel tank and
they have also prepared a small sidewalk.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve travel for
the 2022 Annual Safety and Loss Control Training Conference, November 2 and November 3, 2022,
at the Ramkota in Pierre, SD.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins, to approve hosting the Black Hills
Association of Highway Superintendents Meeting on December 7, 2022 at Prairie Winds Casino, in
the amount of $301.00.

Bettelyoun updated the Board that the reshaping of County Road #6 has been going well.
The Highway Department has replaced the rear pins in the Batwing mower, changed the oil in the
2021 motor grader and replaced the fuel shut off cable in the 1990 Oshkosh Water Tanker.
Bettelyoun stated that they have Blade 16A, 16, 2, 7, hauled 100 Tons of gravel to 16A and 75 tons
of gravel to 2. The mowing is done on 7, 2, 11, 8, 15, 16A and 16.

Stacy Schmidt, Deputy Auditor, met with the Board. Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded
by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve adding the storage container onto the insurance.



Discussion was held on keeping the booster vaccine incentive the same as the initial motion
made on October 12, 2022.

Discussion was held on supervisors hiring employees as needed, then bring to the board for
approval. The Board agreed that if the supervisor would call between meetings to get a temporary
hire approval, that would be sufficient.

Discussion was held on implementing the Sheriff’s Department policy into the county wide
employee policy the Board is working on.

Concerns were raised about not having enough work for Dispatchers in Oglala Lakota
County, providing more work for current employees and the closeness that was lost with the OST
Tribal Police Department and using the Zuercher Dispatch System through them.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Yellow Bull, to approve having a
special meeting on December 2, 2022 for a working session on the employee policy to begin at 9:00
a.m. and to include Sheriff Herman bringing his policy proposal.

Motion made by Takes the Shield (DuBray), seconded by Yellow Bull, to enter into
executive session as per SDCL 1-25-2 (1) for personnel purposes at 4:18 p.m.

Meeting resumed at 4:32 p.m.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins, to submit any information to the State’s
Attorney’s office regarding Sheriff Herman’s transparency.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Takes the Shield (DuBray), to approve bills as
follows:

GENERAL FUND
AT&T MOBILITY WIRELESS PHONE SHERIFF $54.27
AT&T TELECONFERENCE PHONE CONFERENCE SERVICE $138.69
BEAR RUNNER, RAMON MILEAGE $66.30
BEAM INSURANCE ADMIN. LLC VISION PLAN $45.30
BRODKORB, BLAKE ELECTION RIDE-A-LONG $62.73
CENTURY BUSINESS COPIER LEASE/METER $218.19
TAKES THE SHIELD, ANNA MILEAGE $49.98
EFTPS EFTPS PAYROLL TAXES $11,199.28
FALL RIVER CO. SHERIFF INMATE HOUSING $680.00
FERGUSON, SHARIFAH ELECTION RIDE-A-LONG $106.30
GOLDEN WEST LOCAL PHONE/EMAIL/LONG DISTANCE $449.61
HOPKINS, ARTHUR L MILEAGE $108.12
HUSTEAD LAW OFFICE, P.C. CAAF $1,237.77
LAKOTA TIMES PUBLICATION $1,385.32
MARTINEZ, AUDREY CORONER MILEAGE/ELECTION HELP $65.29
MASTEL, BRUCE WEB HOST/UPDATE/SERVER $35.00



MASTERCARD

MCLEOD'S OFFICE SUPPLY
QUADIENT FINANCE USA, INC
OGLALA SIOUX TRIBE
PENNINGTON COUNTY JAIL
RELIANCE STANDARD

SD ASSN OF COUNTY COMM.
SDML WORKER'S COMP. FUND
SEACHANGE PRINT INNOVATION
SD DEPT OF REVENUE

SD STATE RETIREMENT
THOMSEN REUTERS - WEST
TREASURER - EXPENSES
WHITE HAWK, EUGENIO
YELLOW BULL, WENDELL
BETTELYOUN, ARROW
GOINGS, JULIE

LEBEAU, BESSIE

CARLOW, MICHELLE

TWO BULLS, CONTESSA
JOHNSON, DANIEL

SANTOS, DEREK

PERKINS, BETH

STARR, DELORES

PINO, ERMA

BOYD, TANA

WHITE EYES, CHERYL

RED ELK, RUTH

BIG CROW, DEANNA
BUFFINGTON, SANDRA
YOUNG MAN, LOUELLA
O'ROURKE, CHARLES
FEATHER EARRING, SHIRLENE
BETTELYOUN, RONDA

RED OWL, BRYNDA

SMITH, ANN

STANDING BEAR, WILMA
DONOVAN, MARK

VITALIS, MARGARET
WESTON, ANNABELLE
TREVILLYAN, JULIA

SHIELD, LEXIE

COMER, ALYSSA

COUNTY CREDIT CARD
SUPPLY

POSTAGE

MONTH RENT FOR VET SERVICE OFFICER
INMATE HOUSING

LIFE INSURANCE
CATASTROPHIC LEGAL
2024 WORKMAN'S COMP.
PUBLICATION

AUTO/MI STATE REMITTANCE
SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS
SUBSCRIPTION
TREASURERS OFFICE
MILEAGE

MILEAGE
MILEAGE/ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
MILEAGE/ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION RIDE-A-LONG
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
MILEAGE/ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP
ELECTION HELP

$762.19
$227.49
$416.05
$100.00
$85.00
$82.00
$41.00

$4,739.36

$185.00

$1,207.59
$2,577.40

$296.00
$750.00

$94.86

$65.28
$544.03
$159.18
$150.00
$175.00
$230.90
$176.02
$162.75
$298.42
$217.64
$207.64
$150.00
$176.53
$150.00
$165.10
$229.06
$152.55
$160.20
$219.88

$85.90
$150.00
$175.00
$202.54
$625.64
$185.00
$211.52
$249.26
$175.51
$223.76



THUNDER HAWK, KATHRYN
MARTINEZ, RACHEL

BLACK ELK, KIM
SHOULDERS, CANDACE
COMMISSIONERS
ELECTION

ELECTION

STATE'S ATTORNEY'S OFFICE
VETERAN'S SERVICE OFFICE
SHERIFF ARPA

SHERIFF ARPA

SHERIFF

CORONER

COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE
AT&T MOBILITY
BEAM INSURANCE ADMIN. LLC
PRODUCTIVITY PLUS ACCT
CULLIGAN
DELTA DENTALOF SD
DMC WEAR PARTS LLC
EFTPS
BUCHE HARDWARE & LUMBER

GREAT PLAINS COMMUNICATION

GREAT WESTERN TIRE INC.
JOHN DEERE FINANCIAL
LACREEK ELECTRIC ASSOC
W.D. LARSON COMPANIES
MARTIN AUTO PARTS
MASTERCARD

MCI COMM SERVICE
MENARD'S

RAMKOTA HOTEL

RELIANCE STANDARD

ROSANE CEMENT & CONCRETE
SCOTTS MANUFACTURERS
SDML WORKER'S COMP. FUND
SD STATE RETIREMENT
WESTCO

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

M & P RELIEF

ELECTION HELP
ELECTION RIDE-A-LONG
ELECTION RIDE-A-LONG
ELECTION HELP
OCTOBER SALARIES
OCTOBER SALARIES
OVERTIME

OCTOBER SALARIES
OCTOBER SALARIES
OCTOBER SALARIES
OVERTIME

OCTOBER SALARIES
OCTOBER SALARIES
TOTAL FOR GENERAL FUND

WIRELESS PHONE SHERIFF
VISION PLAN

PARTS

UTILITY

DENTAL PLAN

PART

EFTPS PAYROLL TAXES
SUPPLIES

LOCAL PHONE & INTERNET
SUPPLY

BOMGAARS CHARGES/SUPPLY
UTILITY/ELECTRIC

PARTS

PARTS/SUPPLY

COUNTY CREDIT CARD
LONG DISTANCE

SUPPLY

SAFETY BENEFITS CONFERENCE
LIFE INSURANCE
CONCRETE

PART

2024 WORKMAN'S COMP.
SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS
FUEL/UTILITES

OCTOBER SALARIES
OVERTIME

TOTAL FOR COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE

$175.00
$40.00
$121.60
$157.65
$26,375.00
$4,932.00
$330.00
$500.00
$8,189.33
$20,662.40
$176.40
$9,357.23
$625.00
$105,182.01

$94.31
$29.68
$462.53
$13.00
$306.80
$3,224.48
$10,676.72
$664.25
$220.92
$1,564.85
$531.30
$321.64
$403.68
$206.44
$52.09
$52.17
$679.39
$101.00
$117.75
$1,030.00
$10.43
$6,553.64
$3,967.92
$8,307.28
$46,628.94
$128.84
$86,350.05



MICROFILM IMAGING SYSTEMS

AMERICAN RESCUE PLAN
BEAM INSURANCE ADMIN. LLC
DELTA DENTAL OF SD
EFTPS
MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC
RELIANCE STANDARD
SD STATE RETIREMENT
WOUNDED KNEE DIST. SCHOOL

Motion made by Hopkins, seconded by Yellow Bull, to adjourn at 4:34 p.m.

ATTEST:
/s/Aaron Eberle

SCANNING EQUIPMENT LEASE
TOTAL M & P RELIEF

VISION PLAN

DENTAL PLAN

EFTPS PAYROLL TAXES

RADIO'S

LIFE INSURANCE

SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS

SUMP PUMP WATER PROJECT
TOTAL FOR AMERICAN RESCUE PLAN

$150.00
$150.00

$24.48
$109.70
$4,354.37
$41,754.12
$11.75
$3,334.20
$12,650.00
$62,238.62

TOTAL PAID BETWEEN 10/13/22 AND 11/14/22  $253,920.68

/s/Eugenio White Hawk
Eugenio White Hawk, Chairman

Board of Oglala Lakota County Commissioners

Aaron Eberle, Administrative Assistant

Oglala Lakota County Auditor



TO THE HONORABLE BOARD OF OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS:
I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in

the hands of the County Treasurer of this County on this 31st day of October 2022.

Total Amount of Deposit in First Interstate Bank, HS:
Total Amount of Cash:

Total Amount of Checks in Treasurer's
Possession Not Exceeding Three Days:

FIRST INTERSTATE SAVINGS
First Interstate, HS:

CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT:
First Interstate, HS:
Black Hills Federal Credit Union, HS:

First National Bank of Lead Checking
First Nation Bank of Lead ICS Acct

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts that have
been in the Treasurer's possession over three days:

Sheriff Change Fund:
Election Petty Cash:

RETURNED CHECKS:
Deaton, Tyler

Dated This 31st Day of October 2022.
|
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255,474.18

349.20

1,418.62

2,892,466.47

1,000.00
2,552,992.59

200.00
15.00

110.10

TOTAL $ 5,704,026.16
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Sue Ganje, County Audifor of Oglala Lakota County

County Monies $ 5,592,445.82
Held for other Entities $ 74,302.38
Held in Trust $ 37,277.96
TOTAL $ 5,704,026.16

Teresa Pullen, County Treasurer of Oglala Lakota County

The Above Balance Reflects County Monies, Monies Held in Trust, and
Monies Collected for and to be remitted to Other ENTITIES: SCHOOLS, TOWNS, AND STATE.



TO THE HONORABLE BOARD OF OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS:
I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in
the hands of the County Treasurer of this County on this 30th day of November 2022.

Total Amount of Deposit in First Interstate Bank, HS:

Total Amount of Cash:

Total Amount of Checks in Treasurer's
Possession Not Exceeding Three Days:

FIRST INTERSTATE SAVINGS
First Interstate, HS:

CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT:

First Interstate, HS:

Black Hills Federal Credit Union, HS:
First National Bank of Lead Checking
First Nation Bank of Lead ICS Acct
Schwab 2 year

Schwab 2 year

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts that have
been in the Treasurer's possession over three days:

Sheriff Change Fund:
Election Petty Cash:

RETURNED CHECKS:
Deaton, Tyler

Dated This 30th Day of November 2022.
*

P

Sue Ganje, County Aliditor of Oglala Lakota County

County Monies $ 5,534,283.21
Held for other Entities $ 57,844.67
Held in Trust $ 35,788.19
TOTAL $ 5,627,916.07

$ 101,196.97

$ 1,317.30

$ 6,886.52

$ 3,508,655.85

$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ 13,549.95
$ 1,995,984.38
$ 200.00
$ 15.00
$ 110.10

TOTAL $ 5,627,916.07

Teresa Pullen, County Treasurer of Oglala Lakota County

The Above Balance Reflects County Monies, Monies Held in Trust, and
Monies Collected for and to be remitted to Other ENTITIES: SCHOOLS, TOWNS, AND STATE.
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Oglala Lakota County Sheriff’s Office
906 N. River Street
Hot Springs South Dakota 57747
Phone: 605-441-6215
Robert “Joe” Herman: Sheriff November 2022 Activities

o e e ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok ok sk sk ok ok ok ok sk sk ok sk ok 3k ok 3k ke ok ok ok ok sk sk ok ok ok 3k ok ok 3k ok 3k ok ok ok ok ok 3k sk ok sk ok ok ok sk ok ok ok sk 3k ok ok ok ok oK oK ok ok ok A ok ok ok ok ok ok Kk

Administrative

Law Enforcement Manual Submitted for legal review
Vacancies 2-Positions
Patrol Vehicle Trade in 2012 Rear wheel drive charger to Automax for a 2014 all-

wheel drive Ford Taurus Police Interceptor

LES Activities
Assist with Missing Person Search 1

Sexual Assault 3

[EEY

Motor Vehicle Crash Resulting in Death
Disorderly Conduct-Domestic Related 1
Disorderly Conduct-Trespass 3
Disorderly Conduct-Property Damage 1
Disorderly Conduct-Public Disturbance 1
Disorderly Conduct-Assault 2

OST-Extradition of Tribal Member 1

End of report



From: Brad Miller <Brad @camavision.com>

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 12:30:19 PM

To: Rownea Gerbracht <rowneag@camavision.com>
Subject: RE: Fall River Co SD [hosting GIS data with Vanguard]

Individually price:

Fall River 12,927 parcels - One time license Fee: $7,500

Discounted fees 1 year $3,712.50 per year, 3 year $3,300.00 per year, 5 year
$2,887.50 per year (best deal)

Oglaia Lakota 1,563 parcels - One time license Fee: $7,500

Discounted fees 1 year $1,237.50 per year, 3 year $1,100.00 per year, 5 year
$962.50 per year (best deal)

Combined Pricing:

** Note: One time offer for small counties. ..

We will discount the licenses fee on both counties -$6,500 each (making them
$1000 each, saving $13,000) and apply an additional 5% yearly service fees
discount to both counties, if both sign a 5-year contract. 5 year service fees with
additional 5% Fall River $2,681.25 per year, Oglala Lakota $893.75 per year.



[EXT] Oglala Lakota Property

Becky Brunsing <bbrunsing.sdpaa@sdmunicipalleague.org>
Tue 10/11/2022 1:54 PM

To: Ganje, Sue <Sue.Ganje@state.sd.us>

Cc: Lynn Bren <lbren.sdpaa@sdmunicipalleague.org>

@J 1 attachments (36 KB)
Oglala Lakota County Property - 2022.xls;

Hello again, Sue!

I have also been reviewing Oglala Lakota County property values and would like to discuss a few items.

I have attached the property worksheet from your Safety Benefits property.

When Oglala Lakota County’s property valuation was conducted, Safety Benefits identified one property currently

unscheduled:
* Highway Storage Unit in Batesland

This structure can be covered under the property coverage that the County has with the SDPAA. We have
provided a quote for the highway storage unit. Please review this value as well as the property itself and let us
know if you would like to add this to your property schedule. If not, we will simply exclude them from the

property coverage. .

For the balance of the property locations, we are now required to ensure that your property values listed on the
statement of values are at least 100% of the values prepared by Safety Benefits to maintain replacement cost
coverage. For those locations covered at actual cash value, 85% of the Safety Benefits value is required. Currently,
Oglala Lakota County’s properties are listed at replacement cost. We have provided quotes for updating these
values to maintain the currently selected valuation. Please review this information and let me know if there are

any questions.

If the County does not wish to update the values, we can also move these locations to stated value coverage.

Definitions/Application:
Blanket Limit: The most that would be paid for any one occurrence {example — hail or windstorm, building
collapse etc.) regardless of the number of locations involved.

Replacement Cost Coverage (RCV) — this valuation will pay the lessor of the cost to repair damaged property or
replace it with like kind and quality materials subject to the blanket limit associated with the County’s statement

of values. This amount is currently $258,348.00,

Actual Cash Value Coverage (ACV) — this valuation will pay the lessor of the cost to repair damaged property, or
the value of the property based on the age and condition of the property at the time of the loss. The most that
would be paid in any one loss is the blanket limit associated with the County’s Statement of Values.

Stated Value Coverage (SV) — this valuation will pay the lessor of the cost to repair damaged property, or the cost
to replace damaged property with like kind and quality materials subject to the value associated with the
specifically damaged property. For example: If the Shop Building was completely destroyed and covered at Stated
Value, the most that would be paid would be the cost to repair the property or rebuild it with like kind and quality
materials, but the payment would not currently exceed $168,256 as that is the value associated with the location

on the statement of values.



The additional contribution due would be $141.72 to right size these two properties to 100% of replacement costs
by Safety Benefits recommendations. If you would like to meet and discuss the potential changes and options in
person, please let me know. If you have any questions regarding the quotes, options for updating values etc.
please feel free to reach out via phone/email or text.

Otherwise, please let me know how the County would like to proceed by November 8th, 2022. If we don’t hear
from you, we will move replacement cost coverage properties to stated value and will exclude the one
unscheduled property.

Thank you for your time in reviewing these documents. We appreciate all you do for your County!

Becky Brunsing

Member Services Representative
South Dakota Public Assurance Alliance
www.sdpaaonline.org

208 Island Dr.

Ft. Pierre SD 57532

Direct: (605) 799-3757

Toll Free: {800) 658-3633 Option 2
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lala Lakota Coun Eleﬁtronic Data Processing Hardware
H

0

VAT

. i o HaiNe

Rapid Print Numbering Mach AN-E 1507577 ROD#00453 | § 742.00; $1,000.00: RC

Security Camera System Hwy $ 18,135.00 § 1,000.00 RC

Dell Vostro Laptop e TISBUGB176061 |Election $ 703,00 §$1,600.00 RC

Dell Vostrolaptop 7846053517 |Election $ 703.00. $ 1,000.00 RC

Dymo 450 Turbo Labelwriter — 1750283- Election $ 85.00! $1,000.00 RC

HP Laptop 17.3" Pavilion SilverWin8 ~~ |5CD3511HJW |Hwy $ 598.00° $ 1,000.00 RC

HP 7220 Tower 2UA339CJD 'ROD #00450 | 'S 680.00, § 1,000.00/ RC

Samsung Monitor ) ... |ZTOSHCLDOD |ROD#00451 | §  157.00. $1,000.00 RC

Samsung Monitor Z705HCLDAO (ROD $00452 |'§  157.00 §1,000.00. RC

'HP Laptop 17" e 1B5CG62917F1 (Election 3 180.00, $1,00000 RC_ | §

:Express Vote EV021938056 |Election $ 321000, $1,000.00 RC i

Express Vote i T EV021938066 | Election $ 3210.00 §1,000.00 RC 76
ExpressVote T TTIEY021938053 | Election 5 3,210.00. $ 1,000.00 RC 76,
{Express Vote EV021938056 |Election 5 3,210.00! $1,000.00 RC .76,
{Express Vote ) EV021938094 |Election 5 3,210.00; §1,000.00 RC 16
Express Vote ~_|EV021938047 |Election 5 3,210.00] $ 1,000.00 RC 76,
Express Vote e EV021938103 | Election 5 3,210.00; $ 1,000.00' RC .76
Express Vote ~ o EV021938048 |Election $__3,210.00,_$ 1,000.00. RC ] 8.76
Express Vote Case " |Election 5 170.00 $1,00000 RC | § 0.45
Express Vote Case Election #0435 § 170.00, $ 1,000.00, RC $ 0.46
Express Vote Case i b |Election $ 17000, $1,000.00 RC | § 0.46
Express Vote Case o Election $ 170.00. _$ 1,000.00. RC J 0.46!
|Express Vote Case ) ! Election $ 170.00._§ 1,000.00, RC 3 046
Express Vote Case , eood . IElkction 1§ ~ 170.00 $1,000.00 RC $ 0.46'
Express Vote Case Election $ 170.00._$ 1,000.00 RC ] 0.46
Express Vote Case Election $ 170.00  $ 1,000.00 RC 3 0.46:
ExpressVoteTable =~~~ | Election $ 95.00, $ 1,000.00: RC 3 0.26;
Express Vote Table - Election 3 95.00._$1,000.00 RC g 0.26;
Express Vote Table Election b 95.00_§ 1,000.00. RC g 0.26
Express Vote Table Election 3 95.00, $ 1,000.00' RC : 0.26
Express Vote Table Election B 95.00, § 1,000.00 RC g 0.26
Express Vote Table Election $ 95.00: $1,000.00. RC 0.26
Express Vote Table B . Election k 95.00; $ 1,000.00 RC 0.26,
ExpressVote Table = Election ] 95.00, $1,000.00; RC 0.26!
Dell Latitude Laptop ATAHDD8192 |Election $ 342.00. $ 1,000.00, RC 3 0.93
HP LaserJet Printer VNP3G12150 |Election 3 90,00, $ 1,000.00 RC 3 0.24|
Motorola Handheld Scanner 423 Election ] 235.00; § 1,000.00, RC 3 0.64
Dymo Twin450 Labelwriter 1750160 Election S 180.00;_$ 1,000.00, RC k 0.51
HP DeskJet All in One Printer CN21C3P3ZP |Election 5 150.00:__$ 1,000.00, RC E: 0.41
Dell 27 in. Monitor TTIcNOPWBNRF [Election $  140.00_ $1,000.00' RC 3 0.38,
HP ProDesk 400 CPU e IMXL92120M4 |Election | $ 72900, $1000.00RC | % 189
(10) Ten Poll Pads @ 1350 ea. Election $ 13,850.00 $ 1,000.00 RC 3 37.80.
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GOldﬁnWQS'[ Quote
~ TECHNOLOGIES No.: 68992

2727 N Plaza Dr. Date: 12/9/2022
Rapid City, SD 57702

Phone 605-348-6529 Fax 605-342-1160

Prepared for:

Dave Weishaupl (605) 891-1151 Account No.: 1889
Fall River County Auditor Phone: (605) 745-5145
906 N River Street Fax: (605) 745-3530

Hot Springs, SD 57747 USA

Qty Description uoMm Selt Total

1 HP ProDesk 400 G6 Desktop Mini - i5-10500T 6-Core EA $893.42 $893.42
2.30GHz, 16GB RAM, 256GB NVMe SSD, Windows 11 Pro
1x DisplayPort, 1x HDMI- 3yr. Warranty

1 Project Installation & Configuration EA $525.00 $525.00
Your Price: $1,418.42
Total: = $1,418.42

Prices are valid for 30 days from quote date.

Prepared by:  Chris Bernard, chrisbernard@goldenwest.com Date: 12/9/2022
Accepted by: Date:
Disclaimer

Unless otherwise specified, all labor is charged on a time and materials basis. Any additional service charge or travel will apply.
Any quoted cable runs assume that there is an available cable pathway; If not, additional charges may apply.

Applicable taxes and/or shipping charges may be added to the invoice.

Terms: A 30% down payment may be reguired for sales of $10,000 or more, with the balance due 15 days from the invoice date.
Large, long-term projects are subject to progress billing.

aquote.rpt Printed: 12/9/2022 10:56:09AM Page 1
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[EXT] Distributor Year 2 Allocation Notice — South Dakota

National Opioid Settlements - Directing Administrator
<DirectingAdministrator@NationalOpioidOfficialSettlement.com>
Mon 12/5/2022 10:11 AM

To: National Opioid Settlements - Directing Administrator
<DirectingAdministrator@NationalOpiocidOfficialSettlement.com>

Cc: Roma Petkauskas <rpetkauskas@browngreer.com>;Rachel Motley <rmotley@browngreer.com>

U 1 attachments (277 KB)
National Opioid Settlement Allocation Notice - South Dakota Dist PY2.pdf;

This is an official communication from the Directing Administrator of the National Opioid Settlements.

Attached to this email is a copy of the Payment Year 2 Allocation Notice that provides information on the
allocated payment amounts due to South Dakota and its Subdivisions for the Distributor Settlement
Agreement. Review this Allocation Notice for information on the amounts due to each Beneficiary.
Follow the steps outlined in the Notice to Dispute or Reallocate the amounts. If you accept the allocation
and previously created a portal account and submitted payment instructions, no further action is needed.
If you have not yet created a Portal account and submitted payment instructions, please do so. The
Directing Administrator will begin issuing payments after the applicable deadlines have passed using the
payment instructions provided through the Portal. Keep your payment instructions current in the Portal as
the Directing Administrator will use the information provided to issue settlement payments.

As a reminder, your Case Manager is Rachel Motley whose email address is mmotley@browngreer.com.
We invite you to direct any questions you may have about creating a Portal, providing payment
information, or the National Opioid Settlements in general to Rachel Motley.

Sincerely,

Directing Administrator

National Opioid Settlements

BROWNGREER PLC

Telephone: (888) 441-2010

Directing Administrator@NationalOpioidOfficialSettlement.com

This electronic mail is intended to be received and read only by certain individuals. It may contain information that is privileged or
protected from disclosure by law. If it has been misdirected, or if you suspect you received this in error, please notify me by replying and then

delete this message and your reply. These restrictions apply to any attachment to this email.

04lala - . . ‘
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Settling State South Dakota

I. PAYMENT ALLOCATION DETERMINATION

This Notice is an official communication from the Directing Administrator of the National Opioid Settlements. A
copy of this Notice has been sent to the Enforcement Committee and Settling Distributors pursuant to Section IV.B
of the Distributor Settlement Agreement, dated as of July 21, 2021, as amended, between and among the Settling
States, the Settling Distributors, and Participating Subdivisions (the “Distributor Settlement Agreement”). All
capitalized terms used in this letter have the meanings ascribed to them in the Distributor Settlement Agreement.

Pursuant to Section IV.B and Exhibit M of the Distributor Settlement Agreement, South Dakota’s Total Payment
Year 2 amount is $1,807,559.46, which is broken down in Table 1 in Attachment 1 to this Allocation Notice.

As provided under Section V.C of the Distributor Settlement Agreement, South Dakota has instructed the Directing
Administrator to calculate the intrastate allocations pursuant to a State-Subdivision Agreement (“South Dakota
Opioid Settlement Memorandum of Agreement”). Section lL.A. of the State-Subdivision Agreement states that “all
Opioid Funds will be divided proportionally with 70% allocated to the State (Statewide Share) and 30% allocated to
the Participating Local Governments (Localized Share) pursuant to SDCL 34-20B-116." The Agreement further
states that the “Localized Share will be allocated to the Participating Local Governments in the proportions set out
in Exhibit B, attached hereto, ... which is based upon the opioid negotiation class model developed in connection
with In re: Nat'l Prescription Opiate Litigation, MDL 2804 (N.D. Ohio).” The Agreement further states that “if a
county or city listed on Exhibit B does not join this MOU, then that non-Participating Local Government's allocation
of the Localized Share...will be reallocated to the Statewide Share.” Section IV.A. of the Agreement indicates that
the “Statewide Share will be distributed to the opioid abatement and remediation fund” and the “Localized Share
will be distributed directly to each Participating Local Government.” The intrastate allocations are included as
Attachment 1 to this Allocation Notice.

Undisputed amounts allocated to the Statewide Share and Localized Share for Participating Subdivisions will be
paid no later than the date that is 50 days after the date of this Allocation Notice.

ll. YOURRIGHT TO DISPUTE

Section IV.B.4 of the Distributor Settlement Agreement provides that within twenty-one (21) calendar days of
receiving notice any party may dispute the calculation of the amount to be received by a Settling State or its
Participating Subdivisions listed on Exhibit G as inconsistent with the terms of the Agreement. Written notice must
be provided to the Settlement Fund Administrator, the Enforcement Committee, any affected Settling State, and the
Settling Distributors identifying the nature of the dispute, the amount of money that is disputed, and the Settiing
State(s) affected.

A party has until the Deadline to Dispute Allocation listed at the top of this Allocation Notice to deliver a written
notification of dispute. The amounts listed in this Allocation Notice will be deemed accepted if the Directing
Administrator has not received a party's dispute before midnight Eastern Time on the deadline date. Submit your
written request by email to DirectingAdministrator@NationalOpioidOfficialSettlement.com.




Any party affected by the dispute may object to the notification of dispute. Depending on the nature of the dispute,
contested disputes must be resolved in either the court that entered a state’s Consent Judgment or the National
Arbitration Panel. The Directing Administrator will not disburse any funds potentially affected by a contested dispute
until the dispute is resolved by the court or the National Arbitration Panel.

. To AccepT PAYMENT

If you do not dispute the payment and you have previously created a Portal Account and completed your Payment
Election Forms and W-9 Forms, no further action is needed. The Directing Administrator will begin issuing
payments after the applicable deadlines have passed using the existing payment instructions. [f you have not
previously created a Portal Account, please do so and complete the Payment Election Forms and W-9 Forms to
create payment instructions for any Settlement Payments. Keep your payment instructions current in the Portal
as the Directing Administrator will use these forms to issue settlement payments.

IV. To REALLOCATE PAYMENT

If you wish to reallocate your portion of the allocation to another Participating Subdivision or the State Fund, you
may notify the Directing Administrator of your intent to do so using the Direct Payment and Allocation Election
screen on the Portal before the Deadline to Dispute Allocation included on the Allocation Notice. The Directing
Administrator will not treat a reallocation request as a dispute.

Sincerely,

BrownGreer PLC
Directing Administrator
250 Rocketts Way
Richmond, VA 23231




Total Allocation

$1,807,559.46

$0.00

$1,807,559.46

Allocation Method

South Dakota Opioid Settlement Memorandum of Agreement

70% to Statewide Share

$1,283,370.51

$0.00

$1,283,370.51

SIS

30% to Localized Share

$524,188.95

$0.00

$524,188.95

A. Participating Subdivisions

1. | Aberdeen City 1.7806789284% $9,656.05 $0.00 $9,656.05
2. | AURORA COUNTY 0.1283252150% $695.87 $0.00 $695.87

3. | BEADLE COUNTY 0.8743032704% $4,741.07 $0.00 $4,741.07
4. | BENNETT COUNTY 0.1895703332% $1,027.98 $0.00 $1,027.98
5. | BON HOMME COUNTY 0.6047162426% $3,279.18 $0.00 $3,279.18
6. | Box Elder City ’ 0.2251076108% $1,220.69 $0.00 $1,220.69
7. | Brandon City 0.4012895918% $2,176.06 $0.00 $2,176.06
8. | Brookings City 2.4259611863% $13,155.21 $0.00 $13,155.21
9. | BROOKINGS COUNTY 0.2802421588% $1,519.66 $0.00 $1,519.66
10. | BROWN COUNTY . 1.7764564315% $9,633.15 $0.00 $9,633.15
11. | BRULE COUNTY 0.8045710091% $4,362.93 $0.00 $4,362.93
12. | BUTTE COUNTY 0.8926544344% $4,840.58 $0.00 $4,840.58
13. | CAMPBELL COUNTY 0.0682419048% $370.05 $0.00 $370.05

14. | CHARLES MIX COUNTY 0.8084433424% $4,383.93 $0.00 $4,383.93

1 Final payments to the State and/or Abatement Accounts Funds may vary by +/- $0.01-$0.03 cents to

account for rounding to the nearest cent during Subdivision calculations.

2 Section 11.C. of South Dakota’s State-Subdivision Agreement states that *if a county or city listed on

Exhibit B does not join this MOA, then that non-Participating Local Government's allocation of the

Localized Share as identified in Exhibit B will be reallocated {o the Statewide Share.” In accordance with
this provision, the Distributor Payment listed has been adjusted to reallocate the $18,078.86 that would
have been allocated to Non-Participating Subdivisions from the Localized Share to the Statewide Share.




15. | CLARK COUNTY 0.2550260601% $1,382.92 $0.00 $1,382.92
16. | CLAY COUNTY 0.4415194932% $2,394.22 $0.00 $2,394.22
17. | CODINGTON COUNTY 0.8721266365% $4,729.26 $0.00 $4,729.26
18. | CORSON COUNTY 0.3429322421% $1,859.61 $0.00 $1,859.61
19. | CUSTER COUNTY 1.0868471426% $5,893.62 $0.00 $5,893.62
20. | DAVISON COUNTY 0.6815458005% $3,695.80 $0.00 $3,695.80
21. | DEUEL COUNTY 0.4035008098% $2,188.06 $0.00 $2,188.06
22. | DEWEY COUNTY 0.3699996685% $2,006.39 $0.00 $2,006.39
23. | EDMUNDS COUNTY 0.2529348056% $1,371.58 $0.00 $1,371.58
24. | FALL RIVER COUNTY 2.1968904590% $11,913.03 $0.00 $11,913.03
25. | FAULK COUNTY 0.2772473959% $1,503.42 $0.00 $1,503.42
26. | GRANT COUNTY 0.6923230564% $3,754.25 $0.00 $3,754.25
27. | GREGORY COUNTY 0.5555128599% $3,012.37 $0.00 $3,012.37
28. | HAND COUNTY 0.2401311401% $1,302.15 $0.00 $1,302.15
29. | HANSON COUNTY 0.1484271966% $804.87 $0.00 $804.87
30. | HARDING COUNTY 0.0620805393% $336.64 $0.00 $336.64
31. | HUGHES COUNTY 0.8137066032% $4,412.47 $0.00 $4,412.47
32. | Huron City 0.8308959590% $4,505.68 $0.00 $4,505.68
33. | HUTCHINSON COUNTY 0.5659237410% $3,068.82 $0.00 $3,068.82
34. | JACKSON COUNTY 0.1437421380% $779.47 $0.00 $779.47
35. | JERAULD COUNTY 0.3258250234% $1,766.84 $0.00 $1,766.84
36. | JONES COUNTY 0.0451732597% $244.96 $0.00 $244.96
37. | LAKE COUNTY 0.8273932428% $4,486.69 $0.00 $4,486.69
38. | LAWRENCE COUNTY 2.3838237581% $12,926.71 $0.00 $12,926.71
39. | LINCOLN COUNTY 1.2611723923% $6,838.93 $0.00 $6,838.93
40. | MCCOOK COUNTY 0.3047773840% $1,652.71 $0.00 $1,652.71
41. | MCPHERSON COUNTY 0.1613184030% $874.78 $0.00 $874.78
42. | MEADE COUNTY 3.2698326502% $17,731.25 $0.00 $17,731.25
43. | MELLETTE COUNTY 0.1848247525% $1,002.25 $0.00 $1,002.25.
44. | MINNEHAHA COUNTY 12.2243522517% $66,288.73 $0.00 $66,288.73
45. | Mitchell City 1.5031732329% $8,151.22 $0.00 $8,151.22
46. | OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY 1.3919692864% $7,548.20 $0.00 $7,548.20 K
47. | PENNINGTON COUNTY 8.0611767283% $43,713.17 $0.00 $43,713.17
48. | PERKINS COUNTY 0.3755374403% $2,036.42 $0.00 $2,036.42
49. | Pierre City 0.6216678331% $3,371.10 $0.00 $3,371.10




OTTER

. (i s . . .
51. | Rapid City 6.9492723574% $37,683.67 $0.00 $37,683.67
52. | ROBERTS COUNTY 0.9943780269% $5,392.19 $0.00 $5,392.19
53. | SANBORN COUNTY 0.1141857404% $619.19 $0.00 $619.19
54. | Sioux Falls City 21.6732660428% $117,527.15 $0.00 $117,527.15
55. | Spearfish City 0.8208633410% $4,451.28 $0.00 $4,451.28
56. | SPINK COUNTY 0.7324773052% $3,971.99 $0.00 $3,971.99
57. | STANLEY COUNTY 0.1733882380% $940.23 $0.00 $940.23
58. | SULLY COUNTY 0.0632218131% $342.83 $0.00 $342.83
59. | TODD COUNTY 1.0677859248% $5,790.26 $0.00 $5,790.26
60. | TRIPP COUNTY 0.6252580903% $3,390.57 $0.00 $3,390.57
61. | TURNER COUNTY 0.6536969906% $3,544.79 $0.00 $3,544.79
62. | UNION COUNTY 1.4531041680% $7,879.72 $0.00 $7,879.72
63. | Vermillion City 0.5912781760% $3,206.31 $0.00 $3,206.31
64. | WALWORTH COUNTY 0.5615110318% $3,044.89 $0.00 $3,044.89
65. | Watertown City 1.6132964277% $8,748.39 $0.00 $8,748.39
66. | Yankton City 1.2219897393% $6,626.46 $0.00 $6,626.46
67. | YANKTON COUNTY 1.4233435084% $7,718.33 $0.00 $7,718.33
68. | ZIEBACH COUNTY 0.3085103004% $1,672.95 $0.00 $1,672.95
69. SUBTOTALS 96.66606% $524,188.95 $0.00 $524,188.95
B. Non-Participating Subdivisions?

1. | Buffalo County 0.1823519926% $988.84 $0.00 $0.00

2. | Day County 0.3921680475% $2,126.60 $0.00 $0.00
3. | Douglas County 0.2891518759% $1,567.98 $0.00 $0.00
4. | Haakon County 0.1774497029% $962.25 $0.00 $0.00

5. | Hamlin County 0.3340117176% $1,811.24 $0.00 $0.00
6. | Hyde County 0.0640529112% $347.34 $0.00 $0.00

7. | Kingsbury County 0.3721763025% $2,018.19 $0.00 $0.00
8. | Lyman County 0.3239942300% $1,756.92 $0.00 $0.00
9. | Marshall County 0.5625107271% $3,050.31 $0.00 $0.00
10. | Moody County 0.4743937985% $2,572.48 $0.00 $0.00

3 As indicated in Footnote 2 herein, the Directing Administrator calculated a total initial allocation for the

Non-Participating Subdivisions of $18,078.86 corresponding to 3.333935% of the 30% of total funds
allocated to the Localized Share. The Distributor Payment listed has been adjusted to reallocate the

$18,078.86 that would have been allocated to Non-Participating Subdivisions from the Localized Share to

the Statewide Share.




$876.

iner County .
SUBTOTALS 3.333935% $18,078.86 $0.00
C. All Subdivisions
TOTALS 100.0000% ‘ $542,267.81 $0.00 ] $524,188.95




South Dakota Department of Veterans Affairs

s Liob

DEPARTMENT OF

VETERANS
AFFAIRS

November 10, 2022

Subject: Veterans Service Officer Salary Reimbursement

Dear County Auditor,

With the end of the year rapidly approaching, we would like to bring to your attention the matter of the
state reimbursement for salary paid to your county veterans service officer.

SDCL 33A-1-30 and 33A-1-31 establishes a reimbursement program for the Department to provide
financial assistance to counties and tribes in paying the salaries of their veterans' service officers.

in order for us to reimburse you, we will need a copy of the payroll ledger or individual earnings record
for your veterans service officer covering the period of January 1, 2022, through December 31, 2022.
This copy must be CERTIFIED by you, the county auditor, as a true and factual statement of salary

payments.
Please mail the requested document(s) to:

Audry Ricketts

SD Department of Veterans Affairs
425 E. Capitol

Pierre, SD 57501

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at 605-773-8242.

Sincerely,

Audry Ricketts, Public information Officer
South Dakota Department of Veterans Affairs

605.773.3269 | https://vetaffairs.sd.gov
Soldiers and Sailors Building |425 E. Capitol
Pierre, SD 57501



