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OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
AGENDA
COURTHOUSE - THIRD FLOOR MEETING ROOM
906 NORTH RIVER STREET, HOT SPRINGS SD
WEDNESDAY OCTOBER 11, 2023
(CELL PHONE USAGE IS PROHIBITED DURING THE MEETING)

Call Meeting to Order
Pledge of Allegiance
Review Agenda for Conflicts

Action Agenda Items for Consideration:

*Approve Agenda

*Approve minutes of County Commissioners — September 8, 2023 and September 22, 2023

*Approve the Auditor’s Account with the Treasurer for August, 2023

*Approve travel to the Auditor’s Election Workshop in Pierre, October 18 & 19, 2023 for Bobbie Janis
*Set Supplement & Contingency Hearing for November 8, 2023 at 1:45 pm

(Move any unfinished items to end of meeting)

Lynx Bettelyoun, Highway Superintendent-*Authorization to contact Banner and Associates for Hwy
Project Engineering; possible action
*9/27/2023 Fuel Quotes 2,000-Gal 87 no ethanol gasoline  5,000-Gal 50/50 dyed Diesel

Westco no bid no bid

Vollan Oil $3.33/gallon $4.09/gallon

Nelson’s No Bid No Bid
*Updates

Executive Session, SDCL 1-25-2 (1) Personnel; Executive Session, 1-25-2 (3) Legal

Jerlene Arredondo, Veteran’s Service Officer-*Accept Monthly Report; possible action
*Updates

Sue Ganje, Auditor-*Amend 2024 Budget Levy Resolution; possible action
*Recap of available restricted cash in the General Fund; possible action

Commissioners-*Requested contribution of $1,000.00 in support of the National Center for Public Lands
from the Local Assistance and Tribal Consistency Fund money received, General fund

Restricted surplus monies; possible action

Ramon Bear Runner, Commissioner-*Memorandum of Agreement with Behavior Management
Systems/Oglala Lakota Housing Authority requesting funds
in the amount of $100,000.00 from the Restricted General Fund

Surplus monies; possible action

Teresa Pullen, Treasurer-*Proposed Property Tax payment plan agreement; possible action
*Update regarding Tax Deeds status; possible action
*Discussion regarding Lien Collections; possible action



2:50 Break

3:05 Vanessa Plume-Sheriff-*Hire approval for deputy(s); possible action
*Updates

3:25 Ernie Little, Resident-*Discussion on Moratorium on sale of delinquent Property Tax Certificates;
possible action
*Tribal Motor Fuels and approach permits on Hwy 18
3:45 Public Comment
3:50 Approve bills
4:00 Executive Session, SDCL 1-25-2 (1) Personnel; Executive Session, 1-25-2 (3) Legal
Adjourn
The below Conference Call information is assigned for Commissioner use when unable to attend in person and
pre-arranged agenda items where the presenter is unavailable in person.

Conference Call information (if applicable): Call in #-(848) 777-1212; Conference |D#-65268689

Agendas are set 24 hours prior to a meeting, any items added at the meeting will be heard for informational
purposes only, if any items require action, such action will be deferred to the next meeting.

Oglala Lakota County fully subscribes to the Americans with Disabilities Act. If you desire to attend this public
meeting and are in need of accommodations, please notify the Auditor’s office, (605) 745-5130, 24 hours prior
to the meeting so that appropriate services and auxiliary aids are available.



OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY UNAPPROVED MINUTES OF SEPTEMBER 8, 2023

The Oglala Lakota Board of County Commissioners met in regular session on September 8,
2023. Present: Allyssa Comer, Art Hopkins, Wendell Yellow Bull by telephone and Sue Ganje,
Auditor. Absent: Ramon Bear Runner and Anna Takes the Shield (Dubray).

The Pledge of Allegiance was given and meeting was called to order at 1:30 p.m. by Allyssa
Comer, Vice-Chairwoman. The agenda was reviewed for conflicts. ALL MOTIONS RECORDED
IN THESE MINUTES WERE PASSED BY UNANIMOUS VOTE, UNLESS OTHERWISE
STATED.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins, to approve the agenda.

Motion made by Hopkins, seconded by Yellow Bull, to approve the meeting minutes from
August 9, 2023.

Lynx Bettelyoun, Highway Superintendent, met with the Board to present cost estimate for a
new Highway Shop from Cleary Building Corp. The estimate is $352,801.00. He noted that the
estimate did not include any concrete, insulation, utility or finishing costs. He spoke with Mark
Donovan, Batesland Mayor, to see if the town had any planning and zoning, which they do not.
There’s a possibility that the street next to the shop could be vacated and utilized as well. Hopkins
requested that Bettelyoun make sure that there are exhaust fans included in the building plans.

Bettelyoun inspected Grass Creek Road and determined that it would cost a lot to get the road
up to County standards as well as to maintain it. His recommendation is to not take it on as part of
the County Highway system. He spoke with the Tribe. They indicated that they have intentions of
doing something with the road.

Highway Department updates included notifying the Board that there is a full crew, and
everyone is doing great. There are no equipment concerns at the moment. They have been reshaping,
refencing, blading, filling in holes and mowing.

Yellow Bull entered the meeting in person at 1:48 pm.
Bear Runner entered the meeting at 1:49 pm.

Bettelyoun repeated some of the previously stated information for the Board members that
had just joined the meeting. Yellow Bull recommended contacting the SD School of Mines &
Technology to assist with the Highway shop planning.

Jerlene Arredondo, Veteran Service Officer, met with the Board to present her report. She
asked the Board for guidance on whether to use a “flex time” system to better accommodate Veterans
that need to have later appointment times. The Board agreed that she should do that so that she can
be available when needed. Arredondo went over some of the benefits that the Lakota Federal Credit
Union is offering for Veterans. There has been some trouble with the headstone deliveries. Many are
delivered broken. She contacted the Federal agency that oversees this, they stated that they are going
to be utilizing a different trucking company in the future. Hopkins requested that she reach out to the
newspapers and radio stations to provide information to Veterans regarding different benefits that are



available. Bear Runner invited her to come during the Housing Authority’s radio time slot on
Wednesdays at 9 am. She also wanted to discuss concerns that she had regarding the VA Suicide
Prevention Hotline and/or the 988 hotline’s procedures within the Tribal communities. She discussed
the issue with the Hotline, who questioned the procedure of the Tribal Police. They met with the
Tribal Chief of Police and spoke to him about Critical Incident training to better assist the individuals
that are reaching out for help. He stated that he needs to provide that training to his Officers. Lastly,
she reported that she is working on getting a Veterans’ Day Ceremony honoring 90+ year old Veterans
set up at Prairie Wind Casino. Hopkins and Yellow Bull want to see the County VSO giving coffee,
cake, etc. at Veteran’s wakes, to be taken out of the supply budget.

Bear Runner left the meeting at 2:33 pm and returned at 2:43 pm.

The Board also reviewed the VSO report. Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins,
to accept the VSO report for August 2023 and place on file.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins, to deny the Zuya Akicita Veterans
request for funding to attend the Crow Creek Powwow in Fort Thompson and the Rosebud Powwow
in Rosebud. The Board wants a letter sent to groups to notify them that they need to request funding
well in advance of the event(s) and would need to be present at the Commission Meeting to present
their request.

Anna Takes the Shield (Dubray), joined the meeting at 2:52 pm and took over the meeting as
Chairwoman.

TJ Plume of Plume, Inc., Alpha One Fire and Rescue, met with the Board to request funding
in the amount of $19,050.00 to supplement the department’s budget to purchase equipment. He read
a letter that was placed on file in the Auditor’s Office, he went on to say that, due to having an MOA
with the Tribe that the department is unable to get certified by the SD Fire Marshall and therefore
cannot get any insurance monies allocated to fire departments. Discussion followed regarding other
amounts.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins, to give Plume, Inc., Alpha One Fire and
Rescue $5,000.00. The money is to be part of Resolution 2023-07, limiting funding.

Takes the Shield (Dubray) wants a meeting set up and wishes to attend, with Alpha One and
the SD Fire Marshall to try and get things resolved so that they may become certified.

Sam Kipp, Deputy Director of Equalization, met with the Board to present quotes from
Vanguard for purchasing additional training time.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Comer, to purchase 8 hours of training time from
Vanguard at a cost of $1,320.00.

Teresa Pullen, Treasurer, met with the Board to ask that the discussion regarding Delinquent
Property Tax payment plans be moved to the next meeting. The Board agreed.

Bear Runner again addressed the Board to speak on behalf of the Oglala Lakota Housing
Authority (OLHA) and Behavior Management Systems (BMS) regarding the proposal to assist the



OLHA. They will be requesting that the County contribute $100,000.00 for the first year to help get
things started. Bear Runner passed the presentation out to the Board, only for them to look at before
the next meeting. No action was called for.

Break was taken at 3:25 pm. The meeting resumed at 3:45 pm, with Hopkins absent.

Sue Ganje, Auditor, met with the Board to review the 2024 budget. The Board asked that the
budget be moved to a time after the Sheriff’s presentation.

Hopkins returned to the meeting at 3:50 pm.

Vanessa Plume, Sheriff, met with the Board to present a quote from Liberty Superstores for 3
Dodge 2024 AWD Pursuit Durango’s with 5.7 Hemi engines. Discussion regarding the number of
vehicles to purchase continued.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Hopkins, to purchase 2 new vehicles at a cost of
$52,280.00 each off of the State bid, totaling $101,480.00.

The Memorandum of Agreement between Prairie Wind Casino of the Oglala Sioux Tribe on
the Pine Ridge Indian Reservation and Oglala Lakota County was not signed yet by the Tribe, so no
action was taken.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Comer to approve the bills as follows:

GENERAL FUND

ARREDONDO, JERLENE MONTHLY MEETING MILE $177.48
AT&T MOBILITY WIRELESS PHONE SHERI $95.61
AT&T TELECONFERENCE PHONE CONFERENCE SER $73.35
BEAR RUNNER, RAMON MILEAGE $66.30
BEAR RUNNER, RAMON METH SUMMIT/PIERRE T $283.10
BEAM INSURANCE ADMIN. LLC VISION PLAN . $40.89
BURNS, CINDY 2023 COUNTY CONVENTI $80.00
CENTURY BUSINESS COPIER LEASE/METER $257.93
DELTA DENTAL OF SD DENTAL PLAN $114.50
TAKES THE SHIELD, ANNA MILEAGE $51.00
TAKES THE SHIELD, ANNA COUNTY CONVENTION TR $459.44
TAKES THE SHIELD, ANNA METH SUMMIT PIERRE T $298.40
EFTPS EFTPS PAYROLL TAXES $1,670.33
FALL RIVER CO. SHERIFF INMATE HOUSING $190.00
GOLDEN WEST LOCAL PHONE/EMAIL/LO $201.00
GOLDEN WEST LOCAL PHONE/EMAIL/LO S131.31
HOPKINS, ARTHUR L MILEAGE $108.12
HOPKINS, ARTHUR L COUNTY CONVENTION TR $408.44
HOPKINS, ARTHUR L METH SUMMIT PIERRE T $247.40
LAKOTA TIMES PUBLICATION $681.64
LINCOLN COUNTY TREASURER MI/QMHP JUVENILE $55.00




LYNN'S DAKOTA MART MEETING SNACKS/WATER $45.23
MANLOVE PSYCHIATRIC COURT ORDERED EVALUA $4,500.00
MASTEL, BRUCE WEB HOST/UPDATE/SERV $35.00
MASTERCARD COUNTY CREDIT CARD $1,143.52
MASTERCARD COUNTY CREDIT CARD $301.14
QUADIENT FINANCE USA, INC POSTAGE $379.59
OGLALA SIOUX TRIBE MONTHLY RENT/VSO OFF $100.00
PLUME, VANESSA METH SUMMIT/PIERRE T $74.00
RELIANCE STANDARD LIFE LIFE INSURANCE $32.00
SD ASSN OF COUNTY COMM. 2023 COUNTY CONVENTI $1,000.00
OL COUNTY TREASURER SALES TAX $15.39
SD DEPT OF REVENUE AUTO/MI STATE REMITT $60.00
SD STATE RETIREMENT SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS $1,053.03
THOMSON REUTERS - WEST ONLINE LAW SUBSCRIPT $148.00
WESTERN COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT $500.00
YELLOW BULL, WENDELL MILEAGE $66.30
YELLOW BULL, WENDELL COUNTY CONVENTION TR $451.28
YELLOW BULL, WENDELL METH SUMMIT PIERRE T $283.10
MONTILEAUX, ESPERANZA REISSUED OUTSTANDING $30.60
COMER, ALLYSSA MILEAGE $192.27
COMER, ALLYSSA COUNTY CONVENTION TR $422.72
COMER, ALLYSSA METH SUMMIT PIERRE T $262.70
COMMISSION SALARIES AUGUST SALARIES $1,425.00
STATE'S ATTORNEY SALARIES AUGUST SALARIES $500.00
VETERAN SERVICE OFFICE SALARIES | AUGUST SALARIES $3,189.33
SHERIFF SALARIES AUGUST SALARIES $3,726.92
CORONER SALARIES AUGUST SALARIES $175.00

TOTAL FOR GENERAL

FUND $26,040.56
COUNTY ROAD & BRIDGE
AT&T MOBILITY WIRELESS PHONE SHERI $94.31
BANNER ASSOCIATES, INC. PROFESSIONAL SERVICE $402.00
BEAM INSURANCE ADMIN. LLC VISION PLAN $30.56
LEE RANCH TRUCKING LLC GRAVEL HAULING $39,936.00
CULLIGAN UTILITY $39.00
DELTA DENTAL OF SD DENTAL PLAN $274.70
DMC WEAR PARTS LLC PARTS $5,236.00
DIESEL MACHINERY, INC PARTS $765.85
EFTPS EFTPS PAYROLL TAXES $4,803.43
FAIR MANUFACTURING, INC. FREIGHT $1,000.00
BUCHE HARDWARE & LUMBER SUPPLIES $510.96

GREAT PLAINS COMMUNICATIO

LOCAL PHONE & INTERN

$220.68




HUSKER AUTO PARTS SUPPLY/INVENTORY $52.33
63 INDUSTRIES LLC GRAVEL CRUSHING $163,500.00
MARTIN AUTO PARTS PARTS/SUPPLY $557.08
MASTERCARD COUNTY CREDIT CARD $585.94
MASTERCARD COUNTY CREDIT CARD $1,797.74
MCI COMM SERVICE LONG DISTANCE $49.56
MENARDS SUPPLY $274.59
RELIANCE STANDARD LIFE LIFE INSURANCE $140.75
SAFETY BENEFITS, INC. ANNUAL SAFETY CONFER $75.00
SD STATE RETIREMENT SDRS CONTRIBUTIONS $2,366.03
TRUE NORTH STEEL, INC. CULVERT BANDS $542.81
WARNE CHEMICAL & EQUIP.CO PART $1,392.00
WESTERN COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT $210.90
CRBR ADMIN SALARIES AUGUST SALARIES $20,982.68

TOTAL FOR ROAD &

BRIDGE $245,840.90
FIRE FUND
ALPHA ONE FIRE & RESCUE FUNDING REQUEST $5,000.00

TOTAL FOR FIRE FUND $5,000.00

TOTAL BILLS BETWEEN

08/09-09/08/2023 $276,881.46

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Bear Runner, to approve the 2024 Annual Budget

and Resolution as follows;
General Fund:

Board of County Commissioners from $60,454 to $76,601; Auditor from $76,138 to
$74,806; Total General Government from $587,802 to $602,617; Total Expenditure
Appropriations from $766,895 to $781,710; Total Appropriations from $766,895 to
$781,710; Cash Balance Applied from $213,782 to $§98,121; Current Property Tax
Levy from $322,600 to $333,996; Other Taxes from $9,200 to $6,125; Net Total
Taxes from $331,785 to $340,106; Licenses & Permits from $520 to $320;
Intergovernmental Revenue from $122,600 to $146,800; Charges for Goods &

Services from $52,045 to $49,420; Miscellaneous Revenue from $5,800 to $105,800;
Total Other Revenues from $180,965 to $302,340; Subtotal from $726,532 to
$740,567; Less 5% from ($40,363) to ($41,143); Net Means of Finance from $766,895
to $781,710; Total Appropriations from $766,895 to $781,710

County Road and Bridge Fund:

Cash Balance Applied from $19,945 to ($7,305); Intergovernmental Revenue from
$916,100 to $944,000; Charges for Goods & Services from $900 to $300;
Miscellaneous Revenue from $380 to $330; Total Other Revenues from $917,380 to
$944.,630

Fire Fund: Cash Balance Applied from ($470) to ($626); Current Property Tax Levy from$6,075 to
$6,281; Other Taxes from $150 to $100; Net Total Taxes from $6,225 t0$6,381



Domestic Abuse Fund:
Cash Balance Applied from ($125) to ($55); Licenses & Permits from $100 to $30;
Total Other Revenues from $125 to $55

M & P Fund:
Cash Balance Applied from $150 to $600; Charges for Goods & Services from
$7,250 to $6,800; Total Other Revenues from $7,250 to $6,800.



OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY SPECIAL MEETING, SEPTEMBER 22, 2023

The Oglala Lakota Board of County Commissioner met for a Special meeting September
22, 2023. Present: Anna Takes the Shield (Dubray) Allyssa Comer, Art Hopkins and Sue Ganje,
Auditor. Absent: Wendell Yellow Bull and Ramon Bear Runner.

The meeting was called to order at 10:35 a.m. by Chairwoman Takes the Shield (Dubray),
and the Pledge of Allegiance was given. The agenda was reviewed for conflicts. ALL. MOTIONS
RECORDED IN THESE MINUTES WERE PASSED BY UNANIMOUS VOTE, UNLESS
OTHERWISE STATED.

Wendell Yellow Bull entered the meeting at 10:40 a.m.
Ramon Bear Runner entered the meeting at 10:55 a.m.
The Board met to go over the Employee Policy document dated August 2022.

Motion made by Yellow Bull, seconded by Bear Runner, to schedule another Special
Meeting to continue going over the Employee Policy document dated August 2022 on October 10,

2023 at 10 a.m.

Motion made by Bear Runner, seconded by Yellow Bull, to adjourn at 12:01 p.m.

/s/ Anna Takes the Shield (Dubray),
Anna Takes the Shield (Dubray), Chairwoman

Board of Oglala Lakota County Commissioners

ATTEST:

[s/ Sue Ganje
Sue Ganje, Oglala Lakota

County Auditor



e R e

S o

TO THE HONORABLE BOARD OF OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS:
I hereby submit the following report of my examination of the cash and cash items in
the hands of the County Treasurer of this County on this 31st day of August 2023.

Total Amount of Deposit in First Interstate Bank, HS:

Total Amount of Cash:

Total Amount of Checks in Treasurer's

Possession Not Exceeding Three Days:

FIRST INTERSTATE SAVINGS
First Interstate, HS:

CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT:
Schwab 2 year
Schwab 2 year

Itemized list of all items, checks and drafts that have
been in the Treasurer's possession over three days:

Election Petty Cash:

RETURNED CHECKS:
Deaton, Tyler
Lewis, Harold/Carole

Dated This 31st Day of August 2023.
t

VR

$  876,615.91

$ 2,466.35

$ 25,249.89

$ 2,837,727.62

$ 16,223.66
$ 2,059,640.63
$ 15.00
$ 110.10
$ 220.20

TOTAL $ 5,818,269.36

JQDO)\I\ ph\h’\

Sue Ganje, County Auditor of Oglala Lakota County

County Monies $ 5,723,460.04
Held for other Entities $ 9,751.37
Held in Trust $ 85,057.95
TOTAL $ 5,818,269.36

Teresa Pullen, County Treasurer of Oglala Lakota County

The Above Balance Reflects County Monies, Monies Held in Trust, and
Monies Collected for and to be remitted to Other ENTITIES: SCHOOLS, TOWNS, AND STATE.



M Gmail

Auditor Office <aud@frcounty.org>

Fwd: Vollan oil fuel bud

1 message

E-mail Service <olchwy@hotmail.com>
To: Julie Tomlinsaon <Billing@olcounty.org>

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S21 FE 5G, an AT&T 5G smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: E-mail Service <olchwy@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2023 1:46:00 PM
To: Shawn Rohrich <Shawn@vollanoil.com>
Subject: Re: Vollan oil fuel bud

Got it okay, thank you.

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S21 FE 5G, an AT&T 5G smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Shawn Rohrich <Shawn@vollanoil.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2023 1:44:23 PM

To: olchwy@hotmail.com <olchwy@hotmail.com>
Subject: Vollan oil fuel bud

2000 gallons 87 no ethanol gas price @ 3.33
5000 gallons 50/50 dyed diesel price @ 4.09

Sent from my iPhone

Thu, Sep 28, 2023 at 1:47 PM




Sep 282023 9:11pm  OLCOUNTY 6052881867 1

Qalala Lakota County Highway Department

To: Nelaoins Llleos)14s- 3%

w360 27 m25
Fease nrovide a bid for the following.

o A0 Gallons of Unicaded Gas at § Jaal.
b)) 50 D

5/,020 nsafn‘gn;ti; fqal,

Gallons of Propane 2t § Jaal. .
The Oglala Lakota G i
“ omuyﬂlghwayﬂemekasaimngalhntank, the current propane level

B

e &

County Exemptions / Taxes Applicahle:
Unleaded: Fedeml!axexempl:%te'raxAppfmhle
Diesel: Fegleral and State 2% exempt: $0.02 EPA fax applicabis

Please submit a bid on the above requested fuel, Fax to 4 {605) 283-1867

Oglala Lakota County Highway Departmens
.0 Boxd 208, Batesiand SD 57716
#H: (605)288-1865 Fax: (605) 288-1867 Cell: (605) 441-6261
= afice Use onlv;

_x_ﬂum




Sep 28 2023 9:11pm  OLCOUNTY 6052881867 2

B M RWA CBUNT\’ HIGHWAY DEPAR?MEM?
Date; ?, £ 7" AD2.% '
To: WESTCO, 1-800-762-9905 - -

-';‘hg Oglala Lakota COJ:I’I hway Departmeht isreguestinga quo%e oniueion .
thie 27/  dayof .20.99 . :

Please provide a bid for the following:

Gallons of Unleadet] Gas ats { @
. 5 oD
é %)) H’ons c}f/ Diesel at$ [gak-

_Gallons of Propana at 5 / gai.

The Ogiala Lakota County Highway Dept. propane tank is ¢ l,ﬂﬂo-gaﬂan tonk
© the current propane fevelis pereent.

Signature: . ' Date:

Lounty Exemptions / Taxes Appilcable:
tinleaded: Federal tax exempt; State tax applicabie
Diesel: Federal and State tax exempt; $0.02 EPA tax applicabis

- Flease submit a bid on the above requested fuel, faxad to 2-505-288-1867.

Oglala Lakota County Highway Department
PO Box 208, Batesland, SD 57715
Ph - 605-288-1866, Cell — 605-241-6261, Fax— 605-288-1367
Email: oichwy@hotmali.com

For effice use aply:
LResponse

; : - ﬂe flesponse
- . T .




OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY VSO
MONTHLY ACTIVITY REPORT %cm; 26123

OFFICE VISITS ApPOINTMENTS |2 WALK-mstq PHONED / TOTAL_C_j 3

DEATHS TRIBAL MEMBERS (0 NORN-TRIBAL MEMBERS

VETERANS ADMINISTRATION

NEW CLAIMS (e (PERSON o prone )
EXISTING CLAIMS ]'—’r (PERSON |2 puone 2 )

NEW MEDICAL ENROLLMENT Z

pp214 ReQUEsTs | | (oFfice__| | oTHER )

HOME LOAN _| VA STATE HOME OTHER_Z

SD STATE BENEFITS

VETERANS/ACTIVE DUTY BONUS__ | __ BURIAL BENEFITS_ 2~ EDUCATION_ 2~ _
HEADSTONE/SET UP_____ RECORDS/OTHER 2 __ STATEPARKS
HUNTING/FISHING LICENSES LICENSE PLATES DRIVERS LICENSE_____
TRIBAL

TRIBAL VETERANS FLAG_____ FUNERALS/ROLL CALL A
MEETINGS_| __ OTHER

PUBLIC OUTREACH

SOCIAL MEDIA l/ RADIO STATION I/ OTHER

OTHER 0terded VA stnddown in K¢ G423

K\U\ (e dlevdle

\



Appendix D4: Adopted Budget Levies & Resolution

Lovetd o

be appeoSl
t2~11-25

ANNUAL BUDGET FOR OGLALA LAKOTA COUNTY, SD
For the Year January 1, 2024 to December 31, 2024

Tax Levy in

COUNTY TAX LEVIES Dollars $'s/1,000

WITHIN LIMITED LEVY:

* General County Purposes
(10-12-9)

Library

333,964.00| 5.088

LIMITED LEVY (10-12-21) -
SUB TOTAL

OUTSIDE LIMITED LEVY:
County Snow Removal Fund
(34-5-2)

County Road and Bridge
(10-12-13)

Courthouse, Jall, etc., Bldg.
7-25-1)

Bond Interest Sinking
(7-24-18)

Ag Bullding
(7-27-1)

333,964.00| 5.088

UNLIMITED LEVY - SUB TOTAL -

LIMITED AND UNLIMITED

LEVY - SUB-TOTAL

OTHER SPECIAL LEVIES
Secondary Road (Unorg. PT-76)
(31-12-27)

Fire Protection (34-31-3)

333,964.00] 5.088

6,280.00f 0.096

TOTAL TAXES LEVIED BY COUNTY 340,244.00  5.184

* These Amounts Include the 25% to be distributed to cities.

As of 09/08/20213 these levies are not approved by the Department of Revenue

RESOLUTION

ADOPTION OF ANNUAL BUDGET FOR OGLALA LAKOTA
County, South Dakota

Whereas, (7-21-5 thru 13), SDCL provides that the Board of County
Commissioners shall each year prepare a Provisional Budget of all
contemplated expenditures and revenues of the County and all its
Institutions and agencies for such fiscal year and,

Whereas, the Board of County Commissioners did prepare a
Provislonal Budget and cause same to be published by law, and
Whereas, due and legal notice has been given to the meeting of the
Board of County Commissioners for the consideration of such
Provisional Budget and all changes, elimination's and additions

have been made thereto.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, That such provisional budget
as amended and all its purposes, schedules, appropriations,
amounts, estimates and all matters therein set forth, SHALL BE
APPROVED AND ADOPTED AS THE ANNUAL BUDGET OF THE
APPROPRIATION AND EXPENDITURES FOR OGLALA LAKOTA
County, South Dakota and all Its Institutions and agencies for
calendar year beginning January 1, 2024 and ending December 31,
2024 and the same Is hereby approved and adopted by the
Board of County Commissloners of Oglala Lakota

County, South Dakota, this 8th day of September, 2023.

The Annual Budget so adopted Is avallable for public inspection
during normal business hours at the office of the county auditor
Oglala Lakata, County, South Dakota. The accompanying

taxes are levied by Oglala Lakota County for the year

January 1, 2024 through December 31, 2024.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF
Oglala Lakota County, South Dakota

Anna Ta}ei?weSh' i bray), Chairwoman
| 1>
Allyssa C j:cjr:‘isﬂ}ﬁf—,

AW&,C issiongf) <
' _A/"M
Ramon Bear Runner, ngmissloner 2

Wend%eﬂow Bull, Commissloner

)

Wnuditar M o~
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[EXT] Invoice - National Center for Public Lands Counties

Kade Haley <kade@sdcountycommissioners.org>
Fri 9/29/2023 1:45 PM
To:Ganje, Sue <Sue.Ganje@state.sd.us>

[ﬂJ 3 attachments (3 MB)
Center for Public Lands Counties Packet.pdf; Fall River County, South Dakota.pdf; Oglala Lakota County, South Dakota.pdf;

Greetings County Auditors and Commissioners!

On behalf of the SDACC Board of Directors, we are writing to urge your support for the National
Association of Counties (NACo) initiative to establish the National Center for Public Land Counties.
Support of this program was passed unanimously by the SDACC Board of Directors on August 10th, 2023.
As stewards of your county's interests, it is crucial that we recognize the significant role NACo plays on
behalf of counties at the national level and the potential benefits of this new center.

We strongly encourage you to consider your support for the National Center for Public Land Counties.
This one-time investment in our future will pay dividends for years to come by safeguarding our
interests, promoting responsible land management, and fostering collaboration among counties

nationwide.

This one-time payment represents only 1% of the total LACTF dollars your county received. Thanks to
NACo’s unwavering efforts at the national level, these funds were sent directly to counties instead of the
state, allowing you to maintain local control and assure their effective use.

Attached to this email is the invoice itself, as well as detailed information regarding the Center.

Thank you for your attention to this matter, and we look forward to your positive response. If you have
any questions or need further information, please do not hesitate to contact the office.

Best,

Kade Haley

Deputy Director

South Dakota Association of County Commissioners
South Dakota Association of County Officials

211 E Prospect Ave

Pierre, SD 57501

(605) 224-4554



Oglala Lakota County, South Dakota

TO: South Dakota Association of County Commissioners
211 E Prospect Ave
Pierre, SD 57501

National Center for Public Lands Counties (The Center) Request

FORMULA: Total LACTF Dollars received = $100,000.00
TOTALx .01 =5 1,000.00
TOTAL NATIONAL CENTER FOR PUBLIC LANDS contribution = $ 1,000.00

To: South Dakota Association of County Commissioners
From: Oglala Lakota County

Amount of Claim ---$ __1,000.00

Audited and Allowed , 20

, Chairperson

State of South Dakota )
ss.

County of Oglala Lakota

The South Dakota Association of County Commissioners (SDACC) certifies this to be a just and true claim for
payment which conforms to authority granted by law.

TOTAL CONTRIBUTION: $1,000.00

Total Dues Submitted:

This office will submit your payment to NACo on your behalf.



Dear County Commissioners and Auditors,

On behalf of the SDACC Board of Directors, we are writing to urge your support for the National
Association of Counties (NACo) and their initiative to establish the National Center for Public
Land Counties. As stewards of your county's interests, it is crucial that we recognize the
significant role NACo plays on behalf of counties at the national level and the potential benefits

of this new center.

NACo has been a steadfast advocate for counties across the United States, working tirelessly to
address the unique challenges and opportunities faced by county governments. With a long
history of promoting effective and efficient county governance, NACo has proven itself to be an
invaluable resource for counties in South Dakota and nationwide.

The establishment of the National Center for Public Land Counties represents an exciting
development that holds immense promise for counties like yours. Here are some of the key
reasons why contributing to this initiative is of paramount importance:

e A Unified Voice: NACo serves as the unified voice of county governments at the national
level. By supporting the National Center for Public Land Counties, we strengthen our
collective voice and increase our ability to influence federal policies and legislation that
directly impact our counties.

o Resource Hub: The center will serve as a central hub for information, research, and
resources related to public lands, natural resource management, and conservation. This
will be an invaluable asset for our county as we navigate the complexities of land use
and environmental policies.

e Policy Advocacy: NACo has a proven track record of advocating for policies that benefit
counties, including funding for essential programs and initiatives. Contributing to the
National Center for Public Land Counties ensures that our county's interests are
represented and advocated for effectively.

e Networking and Collaboration: The center will facilitate collaboration and knowledge-
sharing among counties facing similar challenges related to public lands and natural
resources. This collaborative environment can lead to innovative solutions and best
practices that benefit us all.

e Economic Opportunities: Public lands play a significant role in our county's economy,
whether through tourism, outdoor recreation, or resource extraction. The center can
help us maximize the economic potential of these lands while ensuring responsible
stewardship.

e Environmental Conservation: As caretakers of our natural resources, it is crucial that we
actively engage in efforts to protect and conserve our public lands. The center will
provide valuable resources and expertise in this regard.



By supporting the National Center for Public Land Counties, we not only enhance our counties’
ability to navigate the complexities of public land management but also contribute to the
broader well-being of counties across the nation. Our participation will help shape the policies
and initiatives that impact us directly, ensuring that your county's unique needs are considered
in the decision-making process.

We strongly encourage you to consider your support for the National Center for Public Land
Counties. This one-time investment in our future will pay dividends for years to come by
safeguarding our interests, promoting responsible land management, and fostering
collaboration among counties nationwide.

This one-time payment represents only 1% of the total LACTF dollars your county received.
Thanks to NACo’s unwavering efforts at the national level, these funds were sent directly to
counties, instead of the state, allowing you to maintain local control and assure their effective
use.

Thank you for your attention to this matter, and we look forward to your positive response. If
you have any questions or need further information, please do not hesitate to contact the
office.



NATIONAL N
ASSOCIATION % e [O
9" COUNTIES

October 14, 2022

Dear state association executive,

County governments are a leading voice in the intergovernmental partnership with federal lands
management agencies. We work with officials from all levels of government, private
stakeholders and other interested parties to reduce fuel loads on federal lands, prudently
develop our natural resources to meet the nation’s economic needs, improve local economies,
enhance recreational access to public lands, and conserve our lands and waters for future

generations.

Understanding our unique role, Congress has invested record sums in programs to support
public lands counties—including Payments In-Lieu of Taxes (PILT), Secure Rural Schools (SRS},
and other revenue sharing programs—in recent years, while also granting new authorities to
federal lands agencies to broaden the scope, pace and scale of their on-the-ground resource
management work with local governments.

To truly benefit from these unique opportunities and investments, counties must accelerate our
evidence-based research, peer information exchanges, and overall understanding of our lessons
learned, emerging trends analysis, and priority public policy issues. Therefore, the National
Association of Counties (NACo) and the Western Interstate Region (WIR) Boards of Directors
both moved at the 2022 NACo Annual Conference in July 2022 to proceed with developing a
National Center for Public Lands Counties (The Center).

The Center will weave together the narrative around public lands counties and the national
interest in our prosperity by showing how public lands are interconnected with the country’s
needs. As just one example, a wildfire on federal land near a major water source could
jeopardize water quality in a large metropolitan region. The Center will give public lands
counties an enhanced opportunity to share these stories with their peers, policymakers, the
media, think tanks and other key influencers to demonstrate how prosperous public lands
counties create a prosperous America. The Center will also utilize digital media, such as podcasts
and video interviews, and develop written county profiles focused on:

e County partnerships with federal agencies, states, tribes and other counties to
reduce wildfire risk, responsibly develop energy and minerals, improve public access
to federal lands, protect watersheds, conserve species and their habitat, and protect
our national parks and other natural treasures

e County investments of PILT, SRS and other natural resource revenue payments to
benefit our citizens and surrounding public lands

» The different economic drivers in rural vs. urban public lands counties

» Development and implementation of county natural resource management plans
and baseline socioeconomic data for environmental analyses

» Resource values of federal lands compared to nearby privately owned lands

—

660 NORTH CAPITOL STREET NORTHWEST | SUITE 400
WASHINGTON, DC 20001 | 202.393.6226 FAX 202.393.2630 | www.NACo.org [l




* Meeting the unique challenges facing public lands counties, such as housing
affordability for residents and federal employees, ensuring a stable tax base to
deliver critical services, and managing infrastructure on federal lands

For the Center to meet its mission and serve as a long-term tool for public lands counties, a
voluntary investment from state associations representing public lands counties is needed.
NACo staff, state associations of counties executives and county officials set a fundraising goal
of $15 million over the next two years to hire the necessary staff to conduct this critical research
and keep the Center on a sustainable financial course. Initially, the Center will need 1-2 hard-
working, passionate and talented writers who can help us tell the county story. We will then
build staffing capacity as appropriate.

We ask that you meet with your members and determine what your state association can
pledge as a voluntary contribution to the Center. NACo staff will reach out early next year to
collect contributions. These funds will be managed under NACo’s 501(c)(3) research foundation
and will not be used for partisan political purposes,

The Center will be governed by a body consisting of the WIR Executive Committee, the NACo
Public Lands Policy Steering Committee Chair and Vice Chairs, the state association executive
from the WIR Immediate Past President’s home state, and the NACo CEQ/ Executive Director.
The governing body will meet on a regular basis to provide updates to county officials, the WIR
Board of Directors and the NACo Board of Directors on the Center’s financial health, research
priorities and media efforts. The Center will also issue an annual report on the previous year's
work and vision for the future at the annual WIR Conference.

Should you have any questions, we encourage you to reach out to Jonathan Shuffield, NACo
Legislative Director for Public Lands, at 512.965.7268 or jshuffield@naco.org.

Sincerely,

I e

Matthew D. Chase
CEO/Executive Director
National Association of Counties



uopepunod Yyaieasay 0QyN ay3 pue
uo13ay ayelsianu] uaaisapn ayy Aq pasamod

$913UNn0d spue| dljqnd s,edisawy Jo Apnis aa130e4d pue Adjjod ayi Supueapy

S913UN0) spue dljgnd 10} J31ud) [euoieN



z | zeog 12go12Q uonEepuUNOod Y21easay 0JYN ayy pue uoiday 21e3S5J91U| UIBISDM S,00VN Aq pasamod

S3)3UN0Y spueq 2ljgnd 40} 191Ud) |euOIBN

s913unod spue| 21jgnd Suloes saiiunioddo pue saduajjeyd Suiunow syl ssaippe pue ‘syJomiau pue sdiysuolie|al
M3U p|ing pue ainyinu ‘sadijoeld uoleaouul yaieasad ‘Adors Ajunod ayj |21 03 @nuURUOD Isnw am ‘YIAIMOH

SIUBWUIDAO0S |B20] YHM XI0M JudWSeUBW 324N0S3] PUNOUS
-3Y3-U0 413y} Jo 3|eas pue 32ed ‘©dods ayl usapeo.q 0} sajouase spuej [elapay 03 saljldoyine mau pajuels osje ssaiduo) .

swelSoud Sulieys anuanal Jay3o pue ‘(SYs) sjooyds |eany a4naas ‘(171d) sexel Jo nari-uj syusawAied Suipnjoul ‘sepunod
spue] o1jqnd j10ddns 03 Ajjuadal swins p103aJ paisanul sey ssaiSuo) ‘9jos anbiun uno jo Suipuelsiapun pasoidwi YUAN e

suoljelauas aininy Joj SI91BM pUB SPUB| N0 BAJISUO0D pue ‘spue| dljgnd 03 SS330€ [BUOI}BBII3] IUBYUS ‘SILIOU0ID

[e20| @A0JdW] ‘SPaaU J]WIOU0IS S,UOI1BU 33 199W 01 $92.N0saJ [ednjeu Jno dojansp Ajjuspnud ‘Spue| |elapa) uo speo|
|any 2anpau 01 sa1lied pajsalajul 19430 PUe SIap|oyYaels 21enlld QUBWILISA0S JO S|OAI] ||B WY S[BIDIHO UM HIOM BN «
salpuage Juswaseuew spue| [edapay Yyiim diysiaulied [eauswuianosiaiul ayy ul siapes] aJe spuawuianos Ajuno) .

LNINIDYNVIA 3DYNO0SIY ANV HILYM ‘ANVT IT19ISNOdSIH NI
3704 ALNNOD FHL ONIANVLSHIANN ¥31139 LNJFNNYIAOD Tvdad3d



¢ | ¢T0E 1900190 UOHEPUNO Y2JBasaY ODYN @Y} pue uoiSay 33e315433u| UI3ISdM S,00VN Aq pasamod

S913UN0) spueq 2ljgnd 40} J93U3) [eUOIIEN

BJl3WY snoJadsoud e a1ea.d sel3unod spue| aijqnd snosadsoid moy alelisuowap 0} s1aduUan|jul
A 4330 pue syuel yuiy ‘elpaw ay3 ‘siauled [elusWIUIBA0SIB1UL ‘S|RIDI0 AJUNOD UYIIM SB140]S 953Y] Sulleys
Aq sa13unod spue| oljqnd 10§ 931N0SJ [BIIUBSSD UE 3 [|IM SSIIUNOY SPUET d1[gnd 10} 193U [BUOIEN BYL

uol3aJ ueqJn adie| e uj Ayjenb ualem szipiedoal pjnoa 32.nos Jajem Jofew e Jeau pue| |eiapa)
Uo auyp|im e ‘sjdwexa Jo4 spasu s,AI3Unod 3yl Yim pajosuuodIalul ale spue| aignd moy Suimoys Aq Aysadsoad
4NO Ul }salajul [euoljeu 8y} pue saj3unod spue| djgnd punoue anielieu 3y} J19Yy1a50] SABIM |[IM 133U BYL

s23uno) spueq dljgnd 104 193ua) JeuoneN ayl Suidojansp Yum pasaosd 01 ZzZ0z
AIn[ Ul UBIBUOD [BNUUY ODYN ZZOTZ @Y1 18 PIAOW Y30q $10303417 JO SPIBOg HIM PUB ODYN 9yl ‘404243YL

UOI}BUIPJO0D [BIUSWIUIBA0CSIRIUI pUR Suolieloge||od Ajlunwwod-aieald-oignd Suipnjpul ‘sdiysiaulied

SAl3eloqe||0d Suldueyua pue Suido|aAsp Jo) sed13oeId Paseq-paduapIng pue JuswaSeurw 924n0Sa4 d|qeuleIsns
0} uoiNqIU0d AJUN0J [B21314D BY] INOCE PAUIRD| SUOSS3| BJBYS PUB DIBN[BAD ‘DIeasal ISNL S2IUN0)

S3ILNNOJ SANV12179Nd 404 43LN3ID TYNOILVYN



v | £20Z 12q0o120 uonepunog Yd31easay 0JYN 3yl pue uoiSay 31e351a3ul ULBISIM 5,00VN Ag patamod

S213UN0) Spueq Jljgnd 40} 191U |euonEeN

diysispea| {4I/) uoi8ay a1eIsiaiu| UISISIAA S,00FN UM PaulanoS-0d pue uonepunod Yyaleasay oJyN ayl ulyiim ‘ssnunod
Spue’ 3j|gnd J0} 191U3) [BUOEN 9] SB UMOLD] ‘puni |Jeasal Mau e Ysi|gelsa 0] sieah om] 1aA0 uolj|lw STS FTVO0D DNISIVHANNd ©

yyeay Ajsisalpolq pue ‘Juawadeuew
sa10ads ‘si91em pue spue| |eJdps} 03 Ss323e J1|gnd padsueyus ‘uoneald qol pue ssausAIBdwWOod J|Wouode ‘uoidsiold
paysJaiem ‘uoliediiw ysi a4p|Im ‘yijeay adedsspue| :se yans ‘saipunod spue| aljgnd Suidey sanss) jo aduel peolq ay3 ssoloe
sao13oead pue SupjewAasjod [edo| pue ajels ‘|esapay Jo uojdasiaiul 2yl uo ansojelp pue sdiysuoljejal |BJUBLLUISA0SI3U] 493504 ©
sa13unod spuej a1gnd Sunoedw (s|aAl] |20l pue a3els ‘|esapay ayi 1e Sulpnjoul) seaioeld pue sajdijod s,uolieu Jno
wJojul pue asueApe 0} Adessadau syliomiau Sujuies] pue ‘swindoyj a)jqnd ‘saipnis ased ‘Yoseasad adi3deld pue Adjjod ayj dojaaeg  ©
spue| 21gnd |e4apa} Yyiim seale u| s|ejd1jo AJunod s ealsawy suloey
sanss| a2130e.ad pue Aajjod anbiun ays jo sizouanpjui pue siajewAisijod Ajunod pue ajejs ‘|euoileu jo Sulpuejsiapun ayj ajueyuy o

‘SIAILO3MA0 -

J1gnd |esauad syl pue ‘ejpaw
3Y1 ‘si1aauanjjul pue siapjoyadjels Ay ‘sidjewAaljod aiels pue |esapay yum Sulpnaul ‘sajjunod spuel d1jgqnd s,eauawy Wol) siapea)
paiulodde pue pajoa|s jo aSueydxa uonewaojul pue Apdeded ‘yoseasas adj3oeld pue Adjjod wuel-Suo] syl asueyuy JALLVHIAINL .

$313UN0J spue| d1jqnd s,e31aWY 10} syJomiau Sujulea] pue ‘Yaseasal ‘Apnis ao13oead pue Adgjod ay3 aduenpy :NOISSIN -«

SAAILI3rd0 ANV NOISSIN




5 | zeoe 1aqong

dleldosdde se saaunosal |ny1oedw pue Sujwwessosd anbjun ‘Ayoedes Suiyels
PIING Usy] ||Im 9\ 's|eod s,423ua) [euolleN 8yl 193w 03 YydJeasal Aay dojaAsp pue 3onpuod pue A1ols AJunod
9Y3 ||21 sn d|3y.ued oym sia3Im pajua|e} pue ajeuoissed ‘Supiom-paey z-T Pasu (1M Jajua) ay3 ‘Ajjelu]

sasod.ind |panijod upsipnd

Aup 0] pasn aq jou jjm spunf asay ] *Sa1UNOD SPUET dIjgNd JOJ 123U |BUCIEN U] UM UOIEIOqE][0d
S;dIM 3oddns 01 uoliepunod yoieasay 0JYN aY1 uiyum (€)(2)T0s e Japun paseuew aq ||Im spuny asayl
121ua) 3yl 01 uoingIuod Atejun|on e se a3pa|d ued uoileDosse d3e1S JIaY) JeYm

€202 ‘T¢ Adenuer Aq aujwiR1ap pue SISWISW JI9Y1 YIM }93L 03 PO)SE BJE SOAIINIIXD UOIIBIIOSSE 31elS
9SJN0J |BIDURULL 3|CRUIRISNS B UO 421U 3y}

daay pue yoJeasas [ed1314d siY} 3NpUod 01 sdiysiaulied pue Aydeded yels ayi pjing 0 sieak om] 1XaU ay3 JOAO
uol|jiw STS jo |eo3 Suisiedpuny e 195 S|BIDI}O AJUNOD PUB SBAIINIDXD SBIIUNOI JO SUOIIBIDOSSE 31B1S ‘Le1s 0JYN

Papaau st sanunod spue| Jljqnd Suljuasaldal SUOIIRII0SSE 31BIS WOJS JUBWISaAUL AIBJUN|OA B ‘S313UN0D Spue|
21|gnd 10} |00} WU31-5U0| & SB AISS PUB UOISSIW S} 133W O} S313UNOY SPUBT JI|gNd 404 J3IU)) [BUOIEN ayy Jo4

TVOD SNISIVHANNA

uonEepUNOY YIleasay OJYN Y3 pue uoSay 33eI5193U| UIDISIM 5,00VN Aq paiamod

S211UN0) Spuey 2ljqnd 104 121U [BUOIIBN




9 | £Z07 19G0120 UOHEPUNO Y2JISAY OIVN Y3 PUB UOISIY B3LISIBIU| UIBISAM S,0DVN Aq paIamog

S9I1luUno) spueq dljgnd 10} 19jua) [euollenN

92U3J3JU0D YIM |eENuUE
9U3 18 24n1NJ 9Y3 404 UOISIA puB oM S, Jeah snoiaald 3y} uo Jodad [Bnuue Ue aNsS] OS|e |[IM 13jud) 3yl .

S1I0JJe elpaw pue saljlold yaleasad ‘yijeay |ejpueul) s,491uUd) [BUOIIBN 9Y3 UO S1032841Q 4O pJeog 0JVN
pue s10333.1J JO pJeog YIAM 3yl 01 saiepdn apiaoid pue siseq Jejnsad e uo 193w [|Im pieog SUIUIBA0D .

pJeog SuluiaA0D aY3 0] UOSIRI| JJB1S SB 9AJDS [|IM SpUe] d1jqnd 104 1010341 DAIR|SISST ODYN  »

1030341 BAIN29X3/03D ODVYN  »

9121S BWOH S,1usplsald 1Sed @1eIpaWW| YA\ S} WOI) SAIINISIXT UOIIRID0SSY 91815

Sd1BYD 92IA puUe uewdiey) 99111wwo)) Supaals Adljod spueldlgnd ODVN .

1UBpISald 154 D1BIPAWIW]| 1§ JUBPISI] DIIA PUOIBS ‘QUBPISBId 3IIA ISII4 QUBPISALd) 391HUWWOD) SAIFNIBAXT YIM

:J0 1SISUOD [|IM [IDUNO) AJOSIAPY

FONVYNHINOD



VOIdIdNY d39ONOYLS "SITILNNOD HIONOUYWLS

2a00vN/Auedwodjwoo uipayu|
03PINGDYN/WOD 2gnInok

S192M L0DVYND

DQoJVN/wWo'q)

BJ0"0QYN MW « 9ZZ9°E6E 202

1000z "O°Q ‘uolBulysemm

00F @InS | 'M'N 192415 |ojideD yuoN 099
SBIUN0D JO UOIEIDOSSY [BUONEN







e ————— —

OST TRIBAL COUNCIL

1

OST H.H.S COMMITTEE

OLHA BOARD OF DIRECTORS
(VACANT)

I

CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER

OGLALA LAKOTA
HOUSING AUTHORITY

OLHA HOUSING CONTRACTS & SECURITY SCRVICES ADMINISTRATIVE COORDINATOR SUPPORTIVE HOUSING HUMAN RESOURCES FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
MAINTENANCE CONSTRUCTION | Non-IHBG programs | | private mortgage M
COORDINATOR METH & MOLD PREVENTION PUBLIC RELATIONS/ EAP | TENANT COMPLIANCE COMPTROLLER
INSURANCE CLAIMS PROJECT l Homeownerasst. fund I Information Tech.
WOUNDED KNEE
I ENVIROMENTAL REVIEW ] TENANT SERVICES SENIOR ACCOUNTANT P g
MEDICINE ROOT BRI, I
| HOUSING ELIGIBILITY OFFICER COHEN HOME —l PAYROLL ACCOUNTANT —] I ﬁnss ‘rant l
WAKPAMNI
L RECORDS DEPT. APARTMENT COMPLEXES I TENANT ACCOUNTANT I I Structural fire I
PORCUPINE
L Comm, Health workers —I
PINE RIDGE . l PROCUREMENT —I
OGLALA ACCOLINTS PAYABLE | 4.D.L. ]
PASS CREEK
o e :
EAGLENEST | - | .
LACREEK | "

T

4 SUAnne Center Drive, Pine Ridge, SD 57770

(605) 867-5161 ~ Info@osIh.org ~ PO box 603 Pine Ridge, S.D. 57770 ~ fax (605 867-1095




Application for Property Tax Payment Plan for back property taxes

**Please be truthful on ALL answers provided. If approved for a payment plan and at a later date you
are found to have been dishonest on your application, you will be removed immediately from the
payment plan.

**Please understand that if approved to be on a property tax payment plan, the payment plan is for
delinguent taxes only. All subsequent taxes are to be brought current each April and October. Monthly
payments are to be made by the agreed upon date. If you default on either keeping current taxes paid
or miss a payment you will be removed from the payment plan and the county could start to take tax
deed on your property.

Applicant’s Full Name:
Second Applicant’s Full Name:
Telephone #:
Applicant’s Mailing address:
Applicant’s Physical address:
Legal Description of property for tax payment plan:

Parcel # of property for tax payment plan:
Amount you wish to pay monthly:
Date you wish to have payments to our office by:

Please list ALL household members in applicant’s home and for the property that the payment planiis
requested for: (If more room is needed please continue on a separate sheet)

Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant
Full Name: D.0.B. Relationship to applicant

Full Name: D.O.B. Relationship to applicant




INCOME:

Do you or anyone in your household or household for payment plan receive income from any of the
following: If yes, how much and how often: (Must provide copies of all income)

__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES
__YES

Name of persons:
Receiving Money

_NO
__NO
_NO
__NO
_NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
_NO
__NO
__NO
_NO
_NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO
__NO

AMOUNT

HOW OFTEN

EMPLOYMENT

SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS

VETERAN BENEFITS

LEASE INCOME FROM INDIAN TRUST LAND

CIVIL SERVICE RETIREMENT

RAILROAD RETIREMENT

SUPPLEMENTAL SECURITY INCOME (SSI)

MILITARY ALLOTMENTS

FRIENDS/RELATIVES OUTSIDE YOUR HOME

NATIONAL GUARD RESERVE

CHILD SUPPORT PROGRAMS

UNEMPLOYMENT COMPENSATION

WORKMAN’S COMPENSATION

INSURANCE SETTLEMENTS

BIA SOCIAL SERVICES

ROOMER/BOARDER, ETC.

PUBLIC OR FEDERAL ASSISTANCE (ADC)

VACATION PAY, SEVERENCE PAY, SICK PAY

STRIKE PAY

CASH GIFTS, AWARDS & PRIZES

SCHOLARSHIPS, EDUCATIONAL LOANS, GRANTS

DIVIDENDS & INTEREST

FOSTER CARE PAYMENTS

ANNUITIES & PENSIONS

ALIMONY

FOOD STAMPS

COMMODITIES

OTHER (SPECIFY)

Amount

Source of Income




EXPENSE INFORMATION

Do you or anyone in your household or household for payment plan pay any of the following? If yes,

how much:

__YES _NO
__YES __NO
__YES __NO
__YES __NO
_YES _ NO
_YES _NO
__YES __NO
__YES __NO
__YES __NO
__YES __NO
_YES _NO
_YES __NO
__YES __NO

Amount
Per Month

Total

Actual rent paid or scheduled principal and interest for a
personal residence, plus property taxes & homeowners insurance cost.
All utilities: Lights Water Fuel

Phone Other
Childcare expenses related to work schedules
Grocery expense plus household supplies & toiletries
Basic auto expense, gasoline & upkeep
Auto ins. , employee paid health, life ins
Monthly health or medical installment payments
Customary monthly expenses for medicine & care
Court ordered child support & alimony payments
Auto installment payments pertaining to ONE vehicle
Standard retirement programs
Income tax & contribution to Social Security & Medicare
Other expenses (clothing etc.)

I, the undersigned applicant, declare and affirm under the penalties of perjury that this application has
been examined by me and to the best of my knowledge and belief, is in all things true and correct.

Applicant

Date

Applicant

Date



FALL RIVER & OGLALA LAKOTA
COUNTY TREASURER

906 North River Street
Hot Springs, SD 57747
Phone: 605-745-5145

Fax: 605-745-3530

Payment Plan guidelines for delinquent property taxes in
Oglala Lakota County

Applicant must make monthly payments of full payment agreed upon or
be removed from the payment plan.

The payment plan is only to be used for delinquent taxes. All future taxes
must be paid current each year.

Parcel must be at least 3 years delinquent in taxes.

Under $10,000 in delinquent taxes, applicant must pay off within 3 years.
Over $10,000 in delinquent taxes the Treasurer and County
Commissioners will determine a payment amount.

For parcel that home sits on only not additional parcels.

Owner of property must live in the home.

Federal poverty guidelines will be followed and are subject to change.
Please see attached sheet.

Payment plan application must be completed in full and all supporting
documents included.

Interest in the amount of .833% is applied monthly to delinquent taxes.



FALL RIVER & OGLALA LAKOTA
COUNTY TREASURER

906 North River Street
Hot Springs, SD 57747
Phone: 605-745-5145

Fax: 605-745-3530

REAL ESTATE TAX PAYMENT AGREEMENT

I, , Wish to enter into an agreement to make payments on
delinquent real estate taxes on the following parcel(s):

Beginning May 1st, 2020, T agree to pay $200.00 per month towards my delinquent taxes on
above parcel(s). This amount is due and payable monthly on the 1st day of each month.
Additional funds may be added at any time. Taxes will be applied to the previous years’
delinquent taxes when adequate funds have been collected with the exception of the tax
certificate year which will be applied last. By South Dakota State law delinquent taxes will
continue to accrue interest on a monthly basis in the amount of .833% of the base tax
amount. This agreement does not stop interest from accruing.

I further agree to keep all subsequent taxes current each April and October. I also agree that
if I default on this agreement, I will be removed from the payment plan and that the county
may start tax proceedings on these particular real estate parcel (s).

Dated this day of ,2023

Applicant’s Name

The Oglala Lakota County Treasurer’s Office by and through its Treasurer, Teresa Pullen,
and the Oglala Lakota County Commissioners, hereby agree to the above tax payment
agreement.

Teresa Pullen Oglala Lakota County Commissioner
Oglala Lakota County Treasurer

Amount Delinquent as of April 2, 2023: § 7,774.08



